Research Journal of Pharmacy and Technology Menika Daharwal <editorfpt@c /= Mon, Aug 26 20105t 2201 PM 9
To: ita noorma rosita

Dear Author,

Thanks for submission of paper. The manuscript no. of submuitted paper 1s RIPT — 8351 /25-08-2019.
Yours truly,

Editor.

On Mon, Aug 26, 2015 at 9:39 AM ita noorma rosita <itanr@yahoo.com> wrote:
Dear RJPT editor,

Herewith | send my article with a tittle:

Characteristics, Stability and Activity of Epigallocatechin Gallate (EGCG)-Chitosan
Microspheres: Effect of Polymer Concentration

and the copy right agreement.

| hope it would be published in your journal.
Thank you.

Best regard, Noorma

Sent: Thu, 14 Nov 2019 at 19:28
Subject: Re: How the progress? RJPT — 8351 /25-08-2019

Ref. No - RJPT-8351 Date - 14/11/2019
To,
NOORMA ROSITA

Pharmaceutics Department,
Faculty Pharmacy, Universitas
Airlangga, Surabaya, Indonesia
itanr@yahoo.com

Subject - Acceptance Letter-RJPT
Dear Author,

With reference to your article titled 'Characteristics, Stability and Activity of Epigallocatechin Gallate (EGCG)-Chitosan
Microspheres: Effect of Polymer Concentration® Author by NOORMA ROSITAT*, YUYUN NAILUFA1, DEWI MELANI
HARIYADI. We wish to bring to your kind notica the following
v We acknowledge the receipt of the above mentioned article.
v The above mentioned article(s) has been sent to the reviewer of expert comments
v The above mentioned article(s) have been accepted for publication in the journal. The probable date of

publication is Research Journal of Pharmacy and Technology;Vol:13No:05:May-:2020

Thank you for your interest in RJPT
Thanking You



Re: Fw: Payment successful for a and v publications_Noorma_8351/25-08-2019 ¥ahoo/inbox

| avpublication avpublication <avpublications@gmail.com=> = Tue Nov13,2019at 722 PM W
To: ita noorma rosita

Received, thank you.

Aand V Publications,

RJPT House,

Lokmanya Grih Nirman Society, Rohanipuram, In-front of Sector- 1,
Pt Deendayal Upadhyay Nagar,

Raipur 492 010. (CG) India.

Phone Mo. 9406051618.

E. mail: avpublications@gmail.com;

www.anvpublications.org
wwnw.ajrconline.org
www.rjptonline.org
wwnw.asianpharmaonline.org
wwwv.enggresearch.net

On Tue, Nov 19, 2019 at 9:40 AM ita noorma rosita <itanr@yahoo.com® wrote:
Dear Editor,

Here with | send my recept payment detail, copy write agreement and transfer of copyright
agreement of my manuscript No:8351/25-08-2019

Powered by 4 Razor, pay

a and v publications

rapuiboric

§$123.00

@ Paid Successfully

Payment Id pay_Di36bK5QioTHg1

Paid On 19th Nov, 2019

Method JOOO- Y0000 - 4627
Card

Mobile Number 6281232238383



On Tuesday, May 5, 2020, 07:31:41 PM GMT+7, Research Journal of Pharmacy and Technology Monika Daharwal
<editor.rjpt@gmail. com> wrote:

Dear Author,

Regards

The submitted manuscript is ready for publication in Research Journal of Pharmacy and Technology (EJPT)
‘ol. 13 Issue 05, May 2020.

The gallery proof of the paper is attaching herewith for any necessary correction if required. please convey by
E. Mail as in the attached format before May 11, 2020.

Thanking vou,
Yours truly,
Editor

Gallery Proof of published article in RJPT _13 05 _ 2020.
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Research Journal of Pharmacy and Technology Monika Daharwal <editorrpt@
To: ita noorma rosita

Dear Authar,

Regards

We have made suggested correction.
Thanks

Editor

Dear Authar,

Regards

We have made suggested correction.
Thanks

Editor

On Wed, May 13, 2020 at 5:49 AM ita noorma rosita <itanr@yahoo.com> wrote:
Dear Editor,

Please find attached my corrections. Thank you and looking forward to see my manuscript published
soon.

Kind Regards,






