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Article Publication Submission
1 message

iwan sahrial hamid <iwan-s-h@fkh.unair.ac.id> Thu, Mar 28, 2019 at 1:09 PM
To: ivji83@yahoo.com
Cc: MUHAMMAD THOHAWI ELZIYAD PURNAMA <thohawi@fkh.unair.ac.id>

Dear

Indian Veterinary Journal Editorial Board
11 Chamiers Road, Nandanam

Chennai 600035. India

Phone # 91 44 2435 1006

| have submitted a manuscript titled "Effectivity of Kaempferia galanga L. Inhibits Vascular Endothelial Growth Factor
(VEGF) and Cyclooxygenase-2 (Cox-2) Expression on Endothelial of Chorioallantoic Membrane".

Please proceed according to the editorial board's procedures. We sincerely hope for a good response from you
regarding the continuation of the journal publishing process.

All the best wishes
Iwan Sahrial Hamid, DVM, M.Sc., PhD

Effectivity of Kaempferia galanga L. Inhibits Vascular Endothelial Growth Factor (VEGF) and

] Cyclooxygenase-2 (Cox-2) Expression on Endothelial of Chorioallantoic Membrane.docx
104K
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Acknowledgement Letter # 107/19

1 message

Ind Vet Journal <ivj83@yahoo.com>
Reply-To: Ind Vet Journal <ivj83@yahoo.com>
To: iwan sahrial hamid <iwan-s-h@fkh.unair.ac.id>

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

Reg. No: 107/19 Dated : 28/03/2019

Dear Dr. lwanSahrial Hamid,

Thu, Mar 28, 2019 at 3:38 PM

We acknowledge the receipt of the following articles entitled “Effectivity of KaempferiagalangalL. Inhibits Vascular
Endothelial Growth Factor (VEGF) and Cyclooxygenase-2 (Cox-2)Expression on Endothelial of Chorioallantoic

Membrane” (lwanSahrial Hamid, et al.).

For any further correspondence, please always quote the Registration Number of the Article.

Editorial Office,

Indian Veterinary Journal,

11 Chamiers Road, Nandanam
Chennai 600035. India

Phone # 91 44 2435 1006
email :ivj83@yahoo.com
Web : www.ivj.org.in

On Thu, 28/3/19, iwan sahrial hamid <iwan-s-h@fkh.unair.ac.id> wrote:

Subject: Article Publication Submission

To: ivj83@yahoo.com

Cc: "MUHAMMAD THOHAWI ELZIYAD PURNAMA" <thohawi@fkh.unair.ac.id>
Date: Thursday, 28 March, 2019, 6:09 AM

Dear Indian Veterinary Journal Editorial

Board11 Chamiers Road, Nandanam

Chennai 600035. India

Phone # 91 44 2435 1006

| have submitted a manuscript titled "Effectivity of
Kaempferia galanga L. Inhibits Vascular Endothelial Growth
Factor (VEGF) and Cyclooxygenase-2 (Cox-2) Expression on
Endothelial of Chorioallantoic

Membrane".

Please proceed according to the editorial

board's procedures. We sincerely hope for a good
response from you regarding the continuation of the journal
publishing process.

All the best wisheslwan Sahrial Hamid,
DVM, M.Sc., PhD

7/18/2021, 7:39 PM
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Article # 107/19 for revision & Referee comments & IVJ revised guidelines
attached

1 message

Ind Vet Journal <ivj83@yahoo.com>
Reply-To: Ind Vet Journal <ivj83@yahoo.com>
To: iwan-s-h@fkh.unair.ac.id

Sun, Apr 14, 2019 at 7:31 PM

Sir / Madam,

Revise the paper according to the referee's comments and corrections marked on the manuscript and resubmit the
revised article as per IVJ format for further action.

Sincerely,

Editorial Office,

Indian Veterinary Journal,

11 Chamiers Road, Nandanam
Chennai 600035. India

Phone # 91 44 2435 1006
email :ivj83@yahoo.com
Web : www.ivj.org.in

2 attachments

& 107-19.pdf
2149K

43 Revised Guidelines.pdf
— 90K
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Revised Manuscript Reg No. 107/19

1 message

iwan sahrial hamid <iwan-s-h@fkh.unair.ac.id> Tue, Apr 23, 2019 at 1:24 PM
To: ivji83@yahoo.com
Cc: MUHAMMAD THOHAWI ELZIYAD PURNAMA <thohawi@fkh.unair.ac.id>

Dear Editorial Board

Indian Veterinary Journal

11 Chamiers Road, Nandanam
Chennai 600035. India

Phone # 91 44 2435 1006

Following this, | sent the revised manuscript with Reg No.107/19. We have revised according to referee comments
and guidelines for the revised format of the Indian Veterinary Journal. | also send back the editor's comment letter and
the referee's assessment that | have followed.

We shall look forward to hearing from you. Please give further process information for our manuscript.

Yours sincerely
Dr. lwan Sahrial Hamid
3 attachments

Manuscript Reg No. 107-19.doc
@ 58K

ﬂ Revised Guidelines.pdf
— 90K

& 107-19.pdf
= 2149K
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Revised Manuscript Reg No. 107/19

1 message

iwan sahrial hamid <iwan-s-h@fkh.unair.ac.id> Tue, Apr 30, 2019 at 10:02 AM

To: ivji83@yahoo.com
Cc: MUHAMMAD THOHAWI ELZIYAD PURNAMA <thohawi@fkh.unair.ac.id>

Dear Editorial Board

Indian Veterinary Journal

11 Chamiers Road, Nandanam
Chennai 600035. India

Phone # 91 44 2435 1006

| sent the revised manuscript with Reg No. 107/19. Previously | sent a revised version but without a marker in the
revision section. | sent it back with a yellow highlight in the revised section.

We shall look forward to hearing from you. Please give further process information for our manuscript.

Yours sincerely
Dr. lwan Sahrial Hamid

2 attachments

@ :\Slloa;uscript Reg No. 107-19.doc

& 107-19.pdf
A 140K
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Demand Letter # 107/19

2 messages

Ind Vet Journal <ivj83@yahoo.com> Mon, May 20, 2019 at 4:13 PM
Reply-To: Ind Vet Journal <ivj83@yahoo.com>

To: iwan-s-h@fkh.unair.ac.id

Cc: iwansahrial123@gmail.com

Dear Dr. lwan Sahrial Hamid,

We wish to inform that the under mentioned article has been accepted for publication (107/19)
“Kaempferia galanga L. Inhibiting Effect on Vascular Endothelial Growth Factor (VEGF) and Cyclooxygenase-2
(Cox-2) Expression on Endothelium of Chorioallantoic Membrane.”

Please remit a sum of USD 220 towards the following charges drawn in favour of the “Editor, Indian Veterinary Journal
“and payable at Chennai.

The money may be transferred into our Bank A/c # 30281291710 Code : 09581 of State Bank of India, Nandanam
Branch, Chennai-600035, India. The money should be transferred infavour of The Editor, Indian Veterinary Journal,
Chennai. Under intimation to the Editor, IVJ.

SBI ACCOUNT DETAILS :

SWIFT CODE : SBININBB455; BANK A/c # 30281291710; BRANCH Code : 09581
RTGS CODE : SBIN0009581; MICR CODE : 600-002-088

On receipt of the amount, acceptance letter and date of publication will be sent to you
Quote the Registration number of the article along with payment

Editorial Office,

Indian Veterinary Journal,

11 Chamiers Road, Nandanam
Chennai 600035. India

Phone # 91 44 2435 1006
email :ivj83@yahoo.com
Web : www.ivj.org.in

@ ?g}r(nand Letter # 107-19.docx

iwan sahrial hamid <iwan-s-h@fkh.unair.ac.id> Tue, May 21, 2019 at 11:45 AM
To: elziyad.9.tsn@gmail.com

[Quoted text hidden]

@ ?glznand Letter # 107-19.docx
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Publication fee for manuscript No. 107/19
1 message

iwan sahrial hamid <iwan-s-h@fkh.unair.ac.id> Fri, May 24, 2019 at 10:26 AM
To: ivji83@yahoo.com
Cc: elziyad.9.tsn@gmail.com

Dear Editorial Team
Indian Veterinary Journal

Following this email, | sent the proof of publication fee for manuscript No.107/19.

Yours sincerely
Dr. Iwan Sahrial Hamid

ﬂ Publication Fee Manuscript No.107-19.pdf
263K
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Acceptance Letter # 107/19

1 message

Ind Vet Journal <ivj83@yahoo.com>

Reply-To: Ind Vet Journal <ivj83@yahoo.com>

To: iwan-s-h@fkh.unair.ac.id

Sir / Madam,

Fri, May 24, 2019 at 5:07 PM

The following article has been accepted and will be published in SEPTEMBER, 2019 issue of Indian Veterinary

Journal.

Editorial Office,

Indian Veterinary Journal,

11 Chamiers Road, Nandanam
Chennai 600035. India

Phone # 91 44 2435 1006
email :ivj83@yahoo.com
Web : www.ivj.org.in

@ IVJ Acceptance Letter - 107-19.docx
785K
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