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Subject: [ijper]:Acknowledgment of Online Submission:ijper_1253_20

To: <ritishom@fk.unair.ac.id>


If you cannot see this page properly, please click here.


Dear Dr. I`tishom,


NOTE: This e-mail is sent to you as one of the contributing authors. If you are not corresponding author, please co-ordinate with the author
designated by your group as the corresponding author for this manuscript


A manuscript has been submitted to our journal Indian Journal of Pharmaceutical Education and Research by Ifan Wafa titled 'Oral Delivery
of Purple Sweet Potato (Ipomoea batatas L.) Extracts-Loaded Carboxymethyl Chitosan and Alginate Nanocapsule in Streptozotocin-
Induced Diabetic Mice'. A copy of the acknowledgment mail is attached here with for your reference.


Thanking you

Editorial Team

Indian Journal of Pharmaceutical Education and Research 


------------------------------------------------------------------

Dear Mr.
Wafa, 


Indian Journal of Pharmaceutical Education and Research has received your manuscript entitled "Oral Delivery of Purple Sweet Potato
(Ipomoea batatas L.) Extracts-Loaded Carboxymethyl Chitosan and Alginate Nanocapsule in Streptozotocin-Induced Diabetic Mice" for
consideration for publication. The reference number for this manuscript is "ijper_1253_20". Kindly quote this in correspondence related to
this manuscript. 


The manuscript is being reviewed for possible publication with the understanding that it is being submitted to one journal at a time and has
not been published, simultaneously submitted, or already accepted for publication elsewhere either as a whole or in part. Online submission
of this article implies that the corresponding author has written consent from all the contributors to act as the corresponding author.


You are requested to send the signed copyright/contributor form within two weeks. The form can be uploaded as a scanned image from y
our area. The decision about the manuscript will be conveyed only on receipt of the form. High-resolution images are required at the time of
acceptance, you should be notified separately for the same if images uploaded by you are not of printable quality.


As per the journal's policy, we are committed to publishing articles in original and plagiarism free in our journal. Hence your article must be
screened for plagiarised content before sending it for peer-review. 


Please note that if the article is not cleared in Plagiarism analysis and found to have plagiarized content more than 10-15%, your article will
not be considered or will be asked to revise accordingly. The entire decision rests with the handling editor.


In case, if you have ithenticate report, you may submit your plagiarism report (Only ithenticate) to the editor along with the manuscript
number, if you don't have the report, you may get the report from EManuscript. 


Please visit or write
to services@emanuscript.in (Service Provider)

https://emanuscript.in/shop/plagiarism-checking-charges/


The Editors will review the submitted manuscript initially. If found suitable, it will follow a double-blinded peer review. We aim to finish this
review process within a short time frame, at the end of which a decision on the suitability or otherwise of the manuscript will be conveyed to
you via this system. During this process, you are free to check the progress of the manuscript through various phases from our online
manuscript processing site https://www.journalonweb.com/ijper.


The journal allows free access (Open Access) to its contents and permits authors to self-archive the final accepted version of the articles on
any OAI-compliant institutional / subject-based repository. The journal does not charge for submission, processing or publication of
manuscripts and except for colour reproduction of
photographs. 


We thank you for submitting your valuable work to the Indian Journal of Pharmaceutical Education and Research. 


Yours sincerely, 

Editor

Indian Journal of Pharmaceutical Education and Research
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------------------------------------------------------------------


Message sent on Tuesday, December 8, 2020
Please add editor@ijper.org as a contact in your E-mail client to ensure that this mail is not considered as a junk mail.


---- END OF MESSAGE ----
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Program Studi Doktor Ilmu Kedokteran <prodis3ik@fk.unair.ac.id>

Fwd: Regarding your Manuscript ijper_1253_20

1 pesan

i'tishom Reny <ritishom@fk.unair.ac.id> 21 Juni 2022 11.19
Kepada: Program Studi Doktor Ilmu Kedokteran <prodis3ik@fk.unair.ac.id>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

Dari: Editor, IJPER <editor@ijper.org>

Date: Jum, 16 Apr 2021 pukul 18.07

Subject: Regarding your Manuscript ijper_1253_20

To: <ifan.ali.wafa-2016@fk.unair.ac.id>

Cc: <ritishom@fk.unair.ac.id>, <david.setyo.budi-2017@fk.unair.ac.id>, <nando.reza.pratama-2016@fk.unair.ac.id>


Dear Author,


Thanks for submitting your manuscript entitled '[ijper_1253_20]: Oral Delivery of Purple Sweet Potato (Ipomoea batatas L.) Extracts-Loaded
Carboxymethyl Chitosan and Alginate Nanocapsule in Streptozotocin-Induced Diabetic Mice' to the Indian Journal of Pharmaceutical
Education and Research.


Your article is under peer-review process and the remarks from the reviewers are expected within 30 days. Kindly note that an Article
Processing Charges of 500 USD is applicable for the papers publishing from Jan 2021. Attached is the factsheet of the journal for your
perusal. Kindly reply along with acceptance to the APC. Do revert if you have any further queries.


Regards

----
Editor, IJPER
No. 9. Floor I, Vinse Towers
Wheeler Road Extn. St. Thomas Town
Bengaluru, Karnataka, INDIA
PIN :560084

Mobile : 9686980760 - [Mon-Fri : 10:30 AM - 4:30 PM IST]
Email : editor@ijper.org 

factsheet_ijper_APC.pdf
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Program Studi Doktor Ilmu Kedokteran <prodis3ik@fk.unair.ac.id>

Fwd: Author Proofing

1 pesan

i'tishom Reny <ritishom@fk.unair.ac.id> 21 Juni 2022 11.16
Kepada: Program Studi Doktor Ilmu Kedokteran <prodis3ik@fk.unair.ac.id>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

Dari: i'tishom Reny <ritishom@fk.unair.ac.id>

Date: Sel, 29 Jun 2021 pukul 10.42

Subject: Re: Author Proofing

To: EManuscript Tech <authorproofs@emanuscript.in>


To 

The Emanuscript Tech


Since we had approved the galley proof of our manuscript titled "Oral Delivery of Purple Sweet Potato (Ipomoea batatas L.) Extracts-
Loaded Carboxymethyl Chitosan and Alginate Nanocapsule in Streptozotocin-Induced Diabetic Mice", we have not received any information
regarding the article processing charges (APC) for publication. We would be grateful if the Emanuscript Tech team could let us know the
information or further steps regarding this information.


Sincerely, 

Dr. Reny I’tishom, M.Si

Department of Medical Biology, Faculty of Medicine, Universitas Airlangga, Surabaya, Indonesia

Pada tanggal Sab, 12 Jun 2021 pukul 20.29 i'tishom Reny <ritishom@fk.unair.ac.id> menulis:

Approved, please proceed.


Regards,

Dr. Reny I`tishom



Pada tanggal Sab, 12 Jun 2021 pukul 17.17 EManuscript Tech <authorproofs@emanuscript.in> menulis:


Dear Author;


We are updated your corrections please check and send your correction or approval mail soon


Regards;
Suriya E 


On Fri, Jun 11, 2021 at 8:32 PM i'tishom Reny <ritishom@fk.unair.ac.id> wrote:


To the Editor



We have updated the galley proof and added some corrections put in the comment tool. Any inquiries please reach us via the email,
thank you.



Regards,

Reny I’tishom


Pada tanggal Jum, 11 Jun 2021 pukul 14.34 i'tishom Reny <ritishom@fk.unair.ac.id> menulis:


I will send my correction soon.


Regards,
Reny I`tishom Ph.D



Pada tanggal Jum, 11 Jun 2021 pukul 12.31 EManuscript Tech <authorproofs@emanuscript.in> menulis:


Dear Author;


We are updated your corrections please check and send your correction or approval mail soon for publication process


Regards;
Suriya E


On Wed, Jun 9, 2021 at 8:58 PM i'tishom Reny <ritishom@fk.unair.ac.id> wrote:


Dear Editor,


We apologize for the delay in responding to emails due to notification errors. Hereby we send the galley proof of
"IJPER_1253_20". We also attached "About Authors" information in word file.


Regards,
Dr. Reny I`tishom



Pada tanggal Rab, 9 Jun 2021 pukul 19.14 i'tishom Reny <ritishom@fk.unair.ac.id> menulis:


I will send it soon. 
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Dr Reny I`tishom



Pada tanggal Rab, 9 Jun 2021 pukul 18.48 EManuscript Tech <authorproofs@emanuscript.in> menulis:


Dear Author

We have sent your galley proof titled “ IJPER_1253_20” of your published paper in earlier email.
Kindly send the
corrections if any or approval for the same. Please note, your
article cannot be published unless we get approval for
the galley proof.

In case, if we dont hear from you, we assume that you are
not willing to continue the publication process with us.

 

Regards

Anitha

On Wed, Jun 2, 2021 at 5:23 PM EManuscript Tech <authorproofs@emanuscript.in> wrote:

Dear Author,




Please find the Galley Proof for your manuscript to be published in the forthcoming issue of “IJPER” scheduled to
launch soon. The galley proof is attached to this email. You are required to send the corrections (If any) using the
Comment tool available in Acrobat X: http://get.adobe.com/reader/  or as scanned image files in JPG format along
with the comments form within 2 Days. Please reply to this email at priority. Please note, we may not be able to do
second corrections (If any) apart from the first corrections that are received. The manuscript will be further
processed for web publication. Hence, thorough checking is expected from your side during this galley proofing.

Kindly submit the corrections within 48 hours.                                               

Please note that the copyright form signed by all authors is mandatory for the publication in Indian Journal of
Pharmaceutical Education and Research. 

Regards;

Anitha J
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Program Studi Doktor Ilmu Kedokteran <prodis3ik@fk.unair.ac.id>

Fwd: Information regarding the article processing charges (APC)

1 pesan

i'tishom Reny <ritishom@fk.unair.ac.id> 21 Juni 2022 11.19
Kepada: Program Studi Doktor Ilmu Kedokteran <prodis3ik@fk.unair.ac.id>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

Dari: Editor, IJPER <editor@ijper.org>

Date: Sel, 13 Jul 2021 pukul 17.41

Subject: Re: Information regarding the article processing charges (APC)

To: i'tishom Reny <ritishom@fk.unair.ac.id>


Dear Author, 
You shall receive the payment receipt from the Accounts department today. 
Regards 

----
Editor, IJPER
No. 9. Floor I, Vinse Towers
Wheeler Road Extn. St. Thomas Town
Bengaluru, Karnataka, INDIA
PIN :560084

Mobile : 9686980760 - [Mon-Fri : 10:30 AM - 4:30 PM IST]
Email : editor@ijper.org 

On Tue, Jul 13, 2021 at 7:27 AM i'tishom Reny <ritishom@fk.unair.ac.id> wrote:

To

Editor-in-Chief




Once the payment is confirmed, we hope to receive the receipt and LoA as soon as possible. So, how long does it take

for the receipt and the LoA to be sent?
Thank you for your consideration.




Sincerely,

Dr. Reny I’tishom, M.Si

Department of Medical Biology, Faculty of Medicine, Universitas Airlangga, Surabaya, Indonesia



Pada tanggal Kam, 1 Jul 2021 pukul 11.46 Editor, IJPER <editor@ijper.org> menulis:


Noted with thanks. We will acknowledge the receipt shortly.
Regards 

----
Editor, IJPER
No. 9. Floor I, Vinse Towers
Wheeler Road Extn. St. Thomas Town
Bengaluru, Karnataka, INDIA
PIN :560084


Mobile : 9686980760 - [Mon-Fri : 10:30 AM - 4:30 PM IST]
Email : editor@ijper.org 




On Wed, Jun 30, 2021 at 12:52 PM i'tishom Reny <ritishom@fk.unair.ac.id> wrote:


To 

Editor-in-Chief



We hereby would like to inform the proof of our APC payment titled "Oral Delivery of Purple Sweet Potato (Ipomoea batatas L.)
Extracts-Loaded Carboxymethyl Chitosan and Alginate Nanocapsule in Streptozotocin-Induced Diabetic Mice" [manuscript id:
ijper_1253_20] as attached in the pdf file. We would be grateful if the editor team could let us know further information regarding
publication.

Thank you for your consideration.



Sincerely, 

Dr. Reny I’tishom, M.Si

Department of Medical Biology, Faculty of Medicine, Universitas Airlangga, Surabaya, Indonesia


Pada tanggal Sel, 29 Jun 2021 pukul 11.50 Editor, IJPER <editor@ijper.org> menulis:


Dear Author, 
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Kindly note that an Article Processing Charges of 500 USD is applicable for the papers publishing from Jan 2021. You can make
the payment using the following details;



Bank Account Details:

Account Name: EMANUSCRIPT TECHNOLOGIES

Account Number : : 50200028208099

Bank Name : HDFC Bank

IFSC Code : HDFC0003790

SWIFT CODE: HDFCINBB

Type of Account : Current Account

Full Address of Bank: No 74, Keerthi Arcade, Wheelers Road, Cox

Town, Bangalore, 560005, INDIA


Kindly share the details, once the payment is made. 

----
Editor, IJPER
No. 9. Floor I, Vinse Towers
Wheeler Road Extn. St. Thomas Town
Bengaluru, Karnataka, INDIA
PIN :560084


Mobile : 9686980760 - [Mon-Fri : 10:30 AM - 4:30 PM IST]
Email : editor@ijper.org 




On Tue, Jun 29, 2021 at 8:33 AM i'tishom Reny <ritishom@fk.unair.ac.id> wrote:


To 

Editor-in-Chief
Dr Ahmed M,



We are pleased to know that our manuscript titled “Oral Delivery of Purple Sweet Potato (Ipomoea batatas L.) Extracts-Loaded
Carboxymethyl Chitosan and Alginate Nanocapsule in Streptozotocin-Induced Diabetic Mice” [manuscript id: ijper_1253_20] is
accepted and being published in Indian Journal of Pharmaceutical Education and Research. Nevertheless, up until today, we
have not received any notification regarding communication from Emanuscript Technologies. We would be grateful if the editor
could let us know the information regarding the article processing charges (APC) for publication and information regarding
Emanuscript Technologies.



Sincerely, 

Dr. Reny I’tishom, M.Si

Department of Medical Biology, Faculty of Medicine, Universitas Airlangga, Surabaya, Indonesia
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