
01/06/22 19.55Email Airlangga University - Revision Required [BaliMedJ] [Manuscript ID: 3385]

Page 1 of 11https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=33df2c22ab&view=pt&sear…sg-f%3A1729546711164327910&simpl=msg-f%3A1729549810945948060

Dr. dr. Afif Nurul Hidayati, SpKK-K <afif_nurulhidayati@fk.unair.ac.id>

Revision Required [BaliMedJ] [Manuscript ID: 3385]
16 pesan

Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com> 31 Maret 2022 19.13
Kepada: "Dr. Afif Nurul Hidayati, dr., SpKK., FINSDV" <afif_nurulhidayati@fk.unair.ac.id>, drcitradwi@gmail.com

Dear Authors,
Thank you for submitting your article entitled: "Relationship between CD4 levels and mucocutaneous
manifestations in HIV-AIDS patients at Dr. Soetomo General Academic Teaching Hospital, Surabaya,
Indonesia".

Based on our author guidelines, Your article fulfilled the minimal required structure,
https://www.balimedicaljournal.org/index.php/bmj/pages/view/authorguidlines
In order to have a better-structured article, we suggest you edit based on a checklist,
the simplest way, you may use the Publons review checklist.

According to the new International regulation, please fulfill the requirements below:
1. Ethical clearance number and/or informed consent at the end of the manuscript (Confirmed). 
2. Please state your conflict of interest in the paper. (Confirmed)
3. Please state the funding (if any) in your paper. (Confirmed) 
4. Please state each author's contribution. (Confirmed)
5. What is the exclusion criteria in this study? Please clarify it further in the methods section.
6. What is the sampling technique used in this study (e.g consecutive, purposive, random sampling, etc? Please
elaborate it further in the methods section. 
6. What is the mucocutaneous manifestations assessed in this study? Consider explained it further in the methods
section. 
7. The table results need to be insert in the results section instead as the Appendix. 
8. What is the limitation of this study? Please clarify it further in the discussion section.  

Please revise your article with the missing details, and send it back to us in 7 days (April 6th, 2022).

In addition, I do need to remind you that Bali Medical Journal is free to submit and Open Access for our readers.
However, if your manuscript is accepted for publication, as the author, you will be charged 1,000 USD for APC
(not included proofreading). Please confirm if you agree with this information.

Thank you for trusting us with your hard work

Warm regards, 

Editorial Board Member
-- 
Bali Medical Journal (BaliMedJ)
P-ISSN: 2089-1180
E-ISSN 2302-2914
Indexed at:
Web of Science (WOS) Clarivate Analytics
SCOPUS Elsevier
All Indexing Organisation

https://www.balimedicaljournal.org/index.php/bmj/pages/view/authorguidlines
https://mjl.clarivate.com/home?issn=2089-1180&hide_exact_match_fl=true&utm_source=mjl&utm_medium=share-by-link&utm_campaign=search-results-share-this-journal
https://suggestor.step.scopus.com/progressTracker/?trackingID=6F5DA196E346B072
https://balimedicaljournal.org/index.php/bmj/pages/view/indexing
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Dr. dr. Afif Nurul Hidayati, SpKK-K <afif_nurulhidayati@fk.unair.ac.id> 31 Maret 2022 19.16
Kepada: Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com>
Cc: drcitradwi@gmail.com

Yes, I confirm.
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

Dr. dr. Afif Nurul Hidayati, SpKK-K <afif_nurulhidayati@fk.unair.ac.id> 31 Maret 2022 19.23
Draf Untuk: Citra Harningtyas <drcitradwi@gmail.com>

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

Dr. Afif Nurul Hidayati, dr., SpKK., FINSDV <afif_nurulhidayati@fk.unair.ac.id> 31 Maret 2022 19.41
Kepada: Citra Harningtyas <drcitradwi@gmail.com>

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Dr. dr. Afif Nurul Hidayati, SpKK-K" <afif_nurulhidayati@fk.unair.ac.id>
Date: 31 March 2022 19.16.25 GMT+7
To: Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com>
Cc: drcitradwi@gmail.com
Subject: Re: Revision Required [BaliMedJ] [Manuscript ID: 3385]

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

Dr. dr. Afif Nurul Hidayati, SpKK-K <afif_nurulhidayati@fk.unair.ac.id> 1 April 2022 16.33
Kepada: Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com>

Dear Editors, 
We are grateful to the editors and reviewers for their time and constructive comments on our manuscript. We have
implemented your and their comments and suggestions and wish to submit a revised version of the manuscript for
further consideration in the journal. Changes in the initial version of the manuscript are signed by comment.
Please find the revised version in the attachment below. 

In addition, we confirm that if our manuscript is accepted for publication, we are willing to be charged 1,000 USD
for APC (not included proofreading).

We look forward to the outcome of your assessment 

mailto:afif_nurulhidayati@fk.unair.ac.id
mailto:editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com
mailto:drcitradwi@gmail.com
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Yours sincerely, 
Afif Nurul Hidayati
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

2 lampiran

BMJ_Contribution Details- Citra.docx
23K

Rev-BMJ- Citra.docx
53K

Dr. Afif Nurul Hidayati, dr., SpKK., FINSDV <afif_nurulhidayati@fk.unair.ac.id> 1 April 2022 17.03
Kepada: Citra Harningtyas <drcitradwi@gmail.com>

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Dr. dr. Afif Nurul Hidayati, SpKK-K" <afif_nurulhidayati@fk.unair.ac.id>
Date: 1 April 2022 16.33.23 GMT+7
To: Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: Revision Required [BaliMedJ] [Manuscript ID: 3385]

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

2 lampiran

BMJ_Contribution Details- Citra.docx
23K

Rev-BMJ- Citra.docx
53K

Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com> 1 April 2022 21.18
Kepada: "Dr. dr. Afif Nurul Hidayati, SpKK-K" <afif_nurulhidayati@fk.unair.ac.id>, drcitradwi@gmail.com

Dear Authors,

We would like to inform you that the revised version of the manuscript has been well received and forward to
the peer-reviewers. A further suggestion from peer-reviewers is very important to consider the final decision of
the manuscript being accepted/rejected by the editorial boards. Please wait for further information regarding the
publication. 

Best regards

Editorial Board Member

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=33df2c22ab&view=att&th=17fe478f1c7bdc35&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=f_l1g86upq0&safe=1&zw
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=33df2c22ab&view=att&th=17fe478f1c7bdc35&attid=0.2&disp=attd&realattid=f_l1g893cy1&safe=1&zw
mailto:afif_nurulhidayati@fk.unair.ac.id
mailto:editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=33df2c22ab&view=att&th=17fe49491ee50d09&attid=0.1.1&disp=attd&safe=1&zw
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=33df2c22ab&view=att&th=17fe49491ee50d09&attid=0.1.3&disp=attd&safe=1&zw
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[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com> 5 April 2022 13.21
Kepada: "Dr. dr. Afif Nurul Hidayati, SpKK-K" <afif_nurulhidayati@fk.unair.ac.id>, drcitradwi@gmail.com

Dear Authors,

We would like to inform you that the revised version of the manuscript entitled  "Relationship between CD4
levels and mucocutaneous manifestations in HIV-AIDS patients at Dr. Soetomo General Academic
Teaching Hospital, Surabaya, Indonesia [Manuscript ID: 3385]" has been well received.

Final Decision: Accepted with minor revision

The article publishing charge is now payable before the paper can be progressed any further and an invoice is
accessible here (Attachment) (Valid until: April 12th, 2022). 

The acceptance of your paper is subject to all outstanding content-related queries being addressed to the
satisfaction of the Publisher.

If you have any questions about your paper please contact us at any time, we welcome your feedback.

Yours sincerely

Editorial Board Member
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

3385-Invoice BMJ-Citra Dwi Harningtyas.pdf
724K

Dr. dr. Afif Nurul Hidayati, SpKK-K <afif_nurulhidayati@fk.unair.ac.id> 5 April 2022 13.46
Kepada: Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com>
Cc: drcitradwi@gmail.com

Thank you for your information.
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

Dr. Afif Nurul Hidayati, dr., SpKK., FINSDV <afif_nurulhidayati@fk.unair.ac.id> 5 April 2022 13.47
Kepada: Citra Harningtyas <drcitradwi@gmail.com>

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com>
Date: 5 April 2022 13.21.49 GMT+7
To: "Dr. dr. Afif Nurul Hidayati, SpKK-K" <afif_nurulhidayati@fk.unair.ac.id>, drcitradwi@gmail.com
Subject: Re: Revision Required [BaliMedJ] [Manuscript ID: 3385]

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=33df2c22ab&view=att&th=17ff862f4997fd45&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=f_l1lr6guw0&safe=1&zw
mailto:editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com
mailto:afif_nurulhidayati@fk.unair.ac.id
mailto:drcitradwi@gmail.com
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Dr. Afif Nurul Hidayati, dr., SpKK., FINSDV <afif_nurulhidayati@fk.unair.ac.id> 5 April 2022 20.10
Kepada: Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com>
Cc: drcitradwi@gmail.com

Dear Editors,

We would like to inform you that the article publishing charge based on invoice number 3385/BMJ/05042022 has
been paid to the BNI account on Tuesday (April  5th, 2022). We also attached the payment proof for your
reference in this email.

Thank you for your attention to this matter. 
I look forward to hearing from you soon.

Best regards,
Afif Nurul Hidayati

On 5 Apr 2022, at 13.21, Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Authors,

We would like to inform you that the revised version of the manuscript entitled  "Relationship
between CD4 levels and mucocutaneous manifestations in HIV-AIDS patients at Dr. Soetomo
General Academic Teaching Hospital, Surabaya, Indonesia [Manuscript ID: 3385]" has been
well received.

Final Decision: Accepted with minor revision

The article publishing charge is now payable before the paper can be progressed any further and an
invoice is accessible here (Attachment) (Valid until: April 12th, 2022). 

The acceptance of your paper is subject to all outstanding content-related queries being addressed
to the satisfaction of the Publisher.

If you have any questions about your paper please contact us at any time, we welcome your
feedback.

Yours sincerely

Editorial Board Member

On Fri, Apr 1, 2022 at 10:18 PM Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com>
wrote:

Dear Authors,

We would like to inform you that the revised version of the manuscript has been well received
and forward to the peer-reviewers. A further suggestion from peer-reviewers is very important to

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=33df2c22ab&view=att&th=17ff87a2d50b9fe0&attid=0.1.1&disp=attd&safe=1&zw
mailto:editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com
mailto:editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com
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consider the final decision of the manuscript being accepted/rejected by the editorial boards.
Please wait for further information regarding the publication. 

Best regards

Editorial Board Member

On Fri, Apr 1, 2022 at 5:33 PM Dr. dr. Afif Nurul Hidayati, SpKK-K <afif_nurulhidayati@fk.unair.
ac.id> wrote:

Dear Editors, 
We are grateful to the editors and reviewers for their time and constructive comments on our
manuscript. We have implemented your and their comments and suggestions and wish to
submit a revised version of the manuscript for further consideration in the journal. Changes in
the initial version of the manuscript are signed by comment. Please find the revised version in
the attachment below. 

In addition, we confirm that if our manuscript is accepted for publication, we are willing to be
charged 1,000 USD for APC (not included proofreading).

We look forward to the outcome of your assessment 

Yours sincerely, 
Afif Nurul Hidayati

Pada tanggal Kam, 31 Mar 2022 pukul 19.13 Editor Bali Medical Journal
<editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com> menulis:

Dear Authors,
Thank you for submitting your article entitled: "Relationship between CD4 levels and
mucocutaneous manifestations in HIV-AIDS patients at Dr. Soetomo General Academic
Teaching Hospital, Surabaya, Indonesia".

Based on our author guidelines, Your article fulfilled the minimal required structure,
https://www.balimedicaljournal.org/index.php/bmj/pages/view/authorguidlines
In order to have a better-structured article, we suggest you edit based on a checklist,
the simplest way, you may use the Publons review checklist.

According to the new International regulation, please fulfill the requirements below:
1. Ethical clearance number and/or informed consent at the end of the manuscript
(Confirmed). 
2. Please state your conflict of interest in the paper. (Confirmed)
3. Please state the funding (if any) in your paper. (Confirmed) 
4. Please state each author's contribution. (Confirmed)
5. What is the exclusion criteria in this study? Please clarify it further in the methods section.
6. What is the sampling technique used in this study (e.g consecutive, purposive, random
sampling, etc? Please elaborate it further in the methods section. 
6. What is the mucocutaneous manifestations assessed in this study? Consider explained it
further in the methods section. 
7. The table results need to be insert in the results section instead as the Appendix. 
8. What is the limitation of this study? Please clarify it further in the discussion section.  

Please revise your article with the missing details, and send it back to us in 7 days (April 6th,
2022).

In addition, I do need to remind you that Bali Medical Journal is free to submit and Open
Access for our readers. However, if your manuscript is accepted for publication, as the author,
you will be charged 1,000 USD for APC (not included proofreading). Please confirm if you
agree with this information.

Thank you for trusting us with your hard work

mailto:afif_nurulhidayati@fk.unair.ac.id
mailto:editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com
https://www.balimedicaljournal.org/index.php/bmj/pages/view/authorguidlines
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Warm regards, 

Editorial Board Member
-- 
Bali Medical Journal (BaliMedJ)
P-ISSN: 2089-1180
E-ISSN 2302-2914
Indexed at:
Web of Science (WOS) Clarivate Analytics
SCOPUS Elsevier
All Indexing Organisation

-- 
Bali Medical Journal (BaliMedJ)
P-ISSN: 2089-1180
E-ISSN 2302-2914
Indexed at:
Web of Science (WOS) Clarivate Analytics
SCOPUS Elsevier
All Indexing Organisation

-- 
Bali Medical Journal (BaliMedJ)
P-ISSN: 2089-1180
E-ISSN 2302-2914
Indexed at:
Web of Science (WOS) Clarivate Analytics
SCOPUS Elsevier
All Indexing Organisation

https://mjl.clarivate.com/home?issn=2089-1180&hide_exact_match_fl=true&utm_source=mjl&utm_medium=share-by-link&utm_campaign=search-results-share-this-journal
https://suggestor.step.scopus.com/progressTracker/?trackingID=6F5DA196E346B072
https://balimedicaljournal.org/index.php/bmj/pages/view/indexing
https://mjl.clarivate.com/home?issn=2089-1180&hide_exact_match_fl=true&utm_source=mjl&utm_medium=share-by-link&utm_campaign=search-results-share-this-journal
https://suggestor.step.scopus.com/progressTracker/?trackingID=6F5DA196E346B072
https://balimedicaljournal.org/index.php/bmj/pages/view/indexing
https://mjl.clarivate.com/home?issn=2089-1180&hide_exact_match_fl=true&utm_source=mjl&utm_medium=share-by-link&utm_campaign=search-results-share-this-journal
https://suggestor.step.scopus.com/progressTracker/?trackingID=6F5DA196E346B072
https://balimedicaljournal.org/index.php/bmj/pages/view/indexing
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Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com> 6 April 2022 08.03
Kepada: "Dr. Afif Nurul Hidayati, dr., SpKK., FINSDV" <afif_nurulhidayati@fk.unair.ac.id>

Dear Authors,

We have received your payment and we would like to inform you that your manuscript is
now currently being processed by our reviewer and editor.
Please patiently wait until we send you the revised version of your manuscript.

Thank you for trusting us with your hard works.

Best regards   

Editorial Team

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com> 8 April 2022 20.21
Kepada: "Dr. Afif Nurul Hidayati, dr., SpKK., FINSDV" <afif_nurulhidayati@fk.unair.ac.id>, drcitradwi@gmail.com

Letter of Acceptance

08 April 2022

 

 

Dear: Citra Dwi Harningtyas1, Damayanti Damayanti1, Maylita Sari1,

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=33df2c22ab&view=att&th=17ff9d922853b753&attid=0.1.1&disp=inline&safe=1&zw
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=33df2c22ab&view=att&th=17ff9d922853b753&attid=0.1.3&disp=attd&safe=1&zw
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Muhammad Yulianto Listiawan1, Diah Mira Indramaya1, Linda Astari1, Budi Utomo2, Dwi
Murtiastutik1, Setyana Widyantari1, Astindari1, Afif Nurul Hidayati1*

1Department of Dermatology and Venereology, Universitas Airlangga, Dr, Soetomo General Academic Teaching Hospital,
Universitas Airlangga Teaching Hospital, Surabaya, Indonesia

2Department of Public Health Sciences, Faculty of Medicine, Department of Dermatology and Venerology Faculty of
Medicine, Universitas Airlangga, Surabaya, Indonesia

*Corresponding author: afif_nurulhidayati@fk.unair.ac.id

I am very excited to accept your paper entitled:

“Relationship between CD4 levels and mucocutaneous manifestations in HIV-AIDS patients at Dr.
Soetomo General Academic Teaching Hospital, Surabaya, Indonesia.”

Your paper will be published in the issue of Vol. 11 Number 1, 2022. http://dx.doi.org/10.
15562/bmj.v11i1.3385

(Online Link: http://balimedicaljournal.org/index.php/bmj/article/view/3385).

 
And it usually takes 2 to 4 months for your journal to show up at Google Scholar, but if you need it fast, you
may add it up manually using your google scholar account. The CrossRef and DOI number usually activate
in 3 until 6 months.
 
Bali Medical Journal is indexed in Web of Sciences, Scopus, and many other indexing organization: http://
balimedicaljournal.org/index.php/bmj/pages/view/indexing.

Please do not hesitate to contact us if you need anything. It has been a pleasure for us to proofread and edit
your work, and we are looking forward to your colleagues and your other papers in the near future.
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

912 Letter of Acceptance 3385 Citra Dwi Harningtyas.pdf
667K

Dr. Afif Nurul Hidayati, dr., SpKK., FINSDV <afif_nurulhidayati@fk.unair.ac.id> 8 April 2022 20.23
Kepada: Citra Harningtyas <drcitradwi@gmail.com>

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com>
Date: 8 April 2022 20.21.55 GMT+7
To: "Dr. Afif Nurul Hidayati, dr., SpKK., FINSDV" <afif_nurulhidayati@fk.unair.ac.id>,
drcitradwi@gmail.com
Subject: Re: Revision Required [BaliMedJ] [Manuscript ID: 3385]

Letter of Acceptance

mailto:afif_nurulhidayati@fk.unair.ac.id
http://dx.doi.org/
http://balimedicaljournal.org/index.php/bmj/article/view/
http://balimedicaljournal.org/index.php/bmj/pages/view/indexing
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=33df2c22ab&view=att&th=1800956a7aec0bac&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=f_l1qgi8510&safe=1&zw
mailto:editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com
mailto:afif_nurulhidayati@fk.unair.ac.id
mailto:drcitradwi@gmail.com
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[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]
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Dr. Afif Nurul Hidayati, dr., SpKK., FINSDV <afif_nurulhidayati@fk.unair.ac.id> 8 April 2022 21.13
Kepada: Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com>
Cc: drcitradwi@gmail.com

Dear Editors,

We would like to thank you for accepting our manuscript entitled “Relationship between CD4 levels and
mucocutaneous manifestations in HIV-AIDS patients at Dr. Soetomo General Academic Teaching Hospital,
Surabaya, Indonesia” for publication in the Bali Medical Journal.

We again appreciate the kindness of the Editor and Reviewers in helping improve the manuscript.

Best regards, 
Afif Nurul Hidayati

On 31 Mar 2022, at 19.13, Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com> wrote:

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

Dr. dr. Afif Nurul Hidayati, SpKK-K <afif_nurulhidayati@fk.unair.ac.id> 30 Mei 2022 11.12
Draf Untuk: Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com>
Cc: Citra Harningtyas <drcitradwi@gmail.com>

Dear Editors,

We would like to inform you that the article publishing charge based on invoice number 3385/BMJ/05042022 has
been paid to the BNI account on Tuesday (April  5th, 2022). We also attached the payment proof for your
reference in this email.

Thank you for your attention to this matter. 
I look forward to hearing from you soon.

Best regards,
Afif Nurul Hidayati

Dear Editors,

We would like to inform you that the article publishing charge based on invoice number 3385/BMJ/05042022 has
been paid to the BNI account on Tuesday (April  5th, 2022). We also attached the payment proof for your
reference in this email.

Thank you for your attention to this matter. 
I look forward to hearing from you soon.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=33df2c22ab&view=att&th=18009591fd6517e6&attid=0.1.1&disp=attd&safe=1&zw
mailto:editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com
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Afif Nurul Hidayati
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

2 lampiran

image1.jpeg
37K

3385-Invoice BMJ-Citra Dwi Harningtyas.pdf
724K

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=33df2c22ab&view=att&th=181132a620e38c59&attid=0.1&disp=inline&realattid&safe=1&zw
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=33df2c22ab&view=att&th=181132a620e38c59&attid=0.2&disp=attd&realattid&safe=1&zw

