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Acceptance letter

From: Safitri Erma (rma_fispro@yahoo.com)

To: submissionbca@gmail.com

Date: Thursday, June 28, 2018 at 05:41 PM GMT+7

DEAR PR YADAV

I HAVE PAYMENT FOR ACCEPTED IN YOUR JOURNAL USD 210 FOR PUBLICATION ON LINE IN
BIOCHEMICAL AND CELLULAR ARCHIVES.

PLEASE GIVE ME ACCEPTANCE LETTER LIKE OTHER JOURNAL (IN ATTACHEMENT FILE).

THIS ACCEPTANCE LETTER VERY IMPORTANT FOR ME, AS PROOF TO MY INSTANSI

THANK YOU FOR YOUR COOPERATION.

BEST REGARD

Dr. ERMA SAFITRI

Pada Sabtu, 23 Juni 2018 19.50.31 GMT-12, Dr P R Yadav <submissionbca@gmail.com> menulis:

I acknowledge the r slip.
P R Yadav

On Sat, Jun 23, 2018 at 8:01 PM, Safitri Erma <rma_fispro@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Dr.Yadaf,


In attacment file i send proof payment USD 210  for my article accepted in  for publication in Biochemical and
Cellular Archives..



my tittle : 

THE EFFECT OF HYPOXIC PRECONDITION TO THE ABILITY
OF MESENCHYMAL STEM CELLS MIGRATION


Please give me acceptance letter for volume and number issue 2018 in Biochemical and Cellular
Archives..Journal


Thank you for your attention and your cooperation


Best Regard


Dr. Erma Safitri






Pada Kamis, 7 Juni 2018 15.20.36 GMT-12, Dr P R Yadav <submissionbca@gmail.com> menulis:
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You can wait till Bank functioning and pay afterwards Us$ 210.
P R Yadav 


On Wednesday, June 6, 2018, Safitri Erma <rma_fispro@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Dr. P. R. Yadav, Editor-in-Chief, 
Biochemical and Cellular Archives
606/8 South Civil Lines, Muzaffarnagar- 251 001, India. 
 
Please give me information about our article entitle :



HYPOXIC PRECONDITION FOR INDUCE PLURIPOTENCY OF RABBIT’S BONE

MARROW-DERIVED MESENCHYMAL  STEM CELLS


How many I can pay for accepted our article in Biochemical and Cellular
Archives Journal? Because in my country will long holiday and Bank is closed
too (June 9th 2018 - June 21th 2018).


Unless payment can be made through Credit Card.
Long holiday is an "Idul Fitri" 

holiday for  Muslims in our country 

(Indonesia).


Thank you for your attention and cooperation




Best Regard
Dr.Erma Safitri 









Pada Senin, 4 Juni 2018 02.33.00 GMT-12, Dr P R Yadav <submissionbca@gmail.com> menulis:




Yes, we will consider 


On Monday, June 4, 2018, Safitri Erma <rma_fispro@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Dr. P. R. Yadav, Editor-in-Chief, 
Biochemical and Cellular Archives
606/8 South Civil Lines, Muzaffarnagar- 251 001, India. 


Please give me information, 
Whether the new articles that I send is acceptable?
Do I also pay 210 USD? 
Is there a discount?


Thank youfor your attention and cooperation.


Best Regard
Dr. Erma Safitri,DVM,, M.Si.
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Pada Minggu, 3 Juni 2018 13.53.55 GMT-12, Dr P R Yadav <submissionbca@gmail.com> menulis:




okay
P R Yadav


On Sun, Jun 3, 2018 at 3:50 AM, Safitri Erma <rma_fispro@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Dr. P. R. Yadav, Editor-in-Chief, 
Biochemical and Cellular Archives
606/8 South Civil Lines, Muzaffarnagar- 251 001, India. 

 
Due to something then we withdraw the article with the title



THE EFFECT OF HYPOXIC PRECONDITION TO THE
ABILITY OF MESENCHYMAL STEM CELLS MIGRATION
 
Please be allowed to replace the article with a new article with the title







HYPOXIC
PRECONDITION FOR INDUCE PLURIPOTENCY
OF RABBIT’S

BONE
MARROW-DERIVED MESENCHYMAL STEM CELLS



The article we sent has not been previously submitted and has not been submitted for
evaluation in other journals.

 
Please submission our article for published in your journal (Biochemical and Cellular
Archives)

 

Thank you

Best Regard,

Corresponding Author,

Dr. Erma Safitri, M.Si., DVM
Reproduction Veterinary Departemen Veterinary Medicine Faculty  and
Stem Cells Research Division of  Institute Tropical Disease (ITD)
of Universitas Airlangga
Surabaya-Indonesia
Address: Fakultas Kedokteran Hewan, Campus C Universitas Airlangga 60115
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Email: rma_fispro@yahoo.com / erma-s@fkh.unair.ac.id
Mobile phone : +6287853431053




Pada Selasa, 29 Mei 2018 13.18.26 GMT-12, Dr P R Yadav <submissionbca@gmail.com>
menulis:





You can pay as per following details:


Please
note the following:

Name
of the beneficiary: Biochemical and Cellular
Archives

Account:   51790 20100 00786

Bank:   Union Bank of India, D A V College,
Muzaffarnagar,India

Bank
swift Code : UBIN IN BB MRT




P R Yadav, Chief Editor


On Wed, May 30, 2018 at 6:47 AM, Dr P R Yadav <submissionbca@gmail.com> wrote:




I am pleased to inform you that your paper on THE

EFFECT OF HYPOXIC PRECONDITION TO THE ABILITY OF

MESENCHYMAL STEM CELLS MIGRATION by Sri WM Mulyani, Diah S

Ernawati, Eha R Astuti and Erma Safitri has been accepted for
publication in  Biochem. Cell. Arch. Your paper will

appear in Vol. 18, No.2,  October 2018.
                    
You are requested to pay UIS $  210/ towards the cost
of publication. The payment should be in favour of the
Biochem. Cell. Arch. payable at Muzaffarnagar.
 
Thanks
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Yours;


On Tue, May 29, 2018 at 8:59 PM, Safitri Erma <rma_fispro@yahoo.com> wrote:






Dear Dr. P R Yadav

I am glad  hear inform for you that our paper

on THE EFFECT OF HYPOXIC PRECONDITION TO THE ABILITY OF

MESENCHYMAL STEM CELLS MIGRATION by Sri WM Mulyani, Diah S

Ernawati, Eha R Astuti and Erma Safitri has been accepted for
publication in  Biochem. Cell. Arch. Our paper will
appear in Vol. 18, No.2,  October 2018.
                    
We will to pay UIS $  towards the cost of publication.
Please advise how much USD should  we pay? and
How to pay?
 



Thanks

Dr. Erma Safitri





Pada Senin, 28 Mei 2018 16.18.42 GMT-12, Dr P R Yadav <submissionbca@gmail.com>
menulis:





I am pleased to inform you
that your paper on THE

EFFECT OF HYPOXIC PRECONDITION
TO THE ABILITY OF

MESENCHYMAL STEM CELLS MIGRATION by Sri WM Mulyani,
Diah S

Ernawati, Eha R Astuti and Erma Safitri has been accepted for
publication in  Biochem.
Cell. Arch. Your paper will

appear in Vol. 18, No.2,  October 2018.
                    
You are requested to pay UIS $  towards the cost
ofpublication. The payment
should be in favour of the
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Biochem. Cell. Arch. payable at Muzaffarnagar.
 
Thanks

Yours;
P R Yadav, Chief Editor


On Wed, Apr 4, 2018 at 1:02 PM, Dr P R Yadav <submissionbca@gmail.com> wrote:



I acknowledge the receipt of your paper for publication in Biochemical and Cellular
Archives.
P R Yadav


On Wed, Apr 4, 2018 at 12:04 PM, Safitri Erma <rma_fispro@yahoo.com> wrote:



Dear Dr. P. R. Yadav, Editor-in-Chief, 
Biochemical and Cellular Archives



606/8 South Civil Lines, Muzaffarnagar- 251 001, India. 



 


I
hereby send our manuscript research article with the tittle : 

THE EFFECT OF
HYPOXIC PRECONDITION TO
THE ABILITY OF MESENCHYMAL STEM CELLS
MIGRATION
 

Keywords:   Bone Marrow Stem Cells; Mesenchymal Stem Cells; Hypoxic
Preconditioning; CXCR4; SDF-1

 

The
article we sent has not been previously submitted and has not
been submitted
for evaluation in other journals.

 
Please submission our article for published in your
 journal
(Biochemical and Cellular Archives)

 

Thank you

Best Regard,

Corresponding Author,

Dr. Erma Safitri, M.Si.,
DVM
Reproduction Veterinary Departemen Veterinary
 Medicine Faculty 
and
Stem Cells
Research Division of  Institute Tropical
Disease (ITD)
of Universitas Airlangga
Surabaya-Indonesia
Address: Fakultas Kedokteran Hewan, Campus C
 Universitas
Airlangga 60115
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