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Cc: rosy-s@fk.unair.ac.id, uch.tott@gmail.com

I have the pleasure to inform you that your paper has been accepted for publication.
Pay 200 US$  as manuscript handling charges.
 
You can make the payment by any of the following methods either

1.You can  pay by PayPal our id is imlp1960@gmail.com

2. Bank details for NEFT
 
Name of account                     Institute of Medico-Legal Publications Pvt Ltd
Bank                                         HDFC Bank
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RTGS/NEFT/IFSC code          HDFC0000728
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Please quote the reference number. Email us the proof of deposit.( scan copy or photograph of the slip of
bank transfer)
Your acceptance letter would be sent after receipt of charges. 
After this no further amendment will be entertained in the manuscript
Note for authors - Please note that your submission is final and no further amendments would be
accepted in manuscript after issue of acceptance letter. You are hereby advised again to check
manuscript. Re submit file if corrections are there. New acceptance letter would not be issued to
change in authors sequence or affiliation
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Prof R K Sharma
Editor, Indian Journal of Forensic Medicine & Toxicology
Former Head , Department of Forensic Medicine, A I I M S , New Delhi
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On Thu, Mar 11, 2021 at 7:39 AM NarraSJ <service@narrasj.org> wrote:
Dear Editor-in-Chief
Indian Journal of Forensic Medicine and Toxicology
 
We are pleased to submit our review article entitled " The Role of Chemical Shift Magnetic Resonance
Imaging (SCMRI) to Differentiate Between Benign and Malignant Vertebral Lesions" for publication
in Indian Journal of Forensic Medicine and Toxicology. 
 
We attest to the fact that all authors listed contributed significantly to the work, have read the manuscript,
attested to the validity and legitimacy of the data and its interpretation, and agree to its submission
to  Indian Journal of Forensic Medicine and Toxicology. Our manuscript not in the process of
submission in other journals. 
 
We hope that this letter can be considered for publication in Indian Journal of Forensic Medicine and
Toxicology. 
 
Sincerely yours,
On behalf, 
Rosy Setiawati, MD
Department of Radiology, Medical Faculty, Airlangga University
Jl. Mayjen Prof. Dr. Moestopo No.47, Surabaya, Indonesia

DISCLAIMER:
This e-mail and its contents as well as any attachment(s) are solely for the addressee(s) only and may contain
privileged and confidential information. Kindly notify the sender and delete this e-mail and all copies in your
possession if you are not the intended recipient(s). Any disclosure, copying, distribution, or use of the contents of
this information is prohibited.
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Find an enclosed soft copy of the acceptance letter as attachment. 
With warm regards
Yours sincerely

Prof R K Sharma
Editor, Indian Journal of Forensic Medicine & Toxicology
Former Head , Department of Forensic Medicine, A I I M S , New Delhi
http://medicopublication.com/index.php/ijfmt/index
www.ijfmt.com

Address for Correspondence

Dr R K Sharma
Editor, IJFMT
Institute of Medico-legal Publications
Logix Office Tower, Unit No. 1704, Logix City Centre Mall
Sector- 32, Noida - 201 301 (Uttar Pradesh)   
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On Tue, Mar 16, 2021 at 2:15 PM NarraSJ <service@narrasj.org> wrote:
Dear Dr. Sharma, 

We have made the payment as instructed. We would like to inform you that the payment was made by Dr. Harapan
using paypal (Australia). 
The receipt of payment is attached herewith for your reference. 

Thank you for your help and hope we could receive the Acceptance Letter soon from your end. 

Best regards
On behalf authors

On Mon, 15 Mar 2021 at 15:30, Indian Journal of Forensic Medicine & Toxicology <editor.ijfmt@gmail.com> wrote:
I have the pleasure to inform you that your paper has been accepted for publication.
Pay 200 US$  as manuscript handling charges.
 
You can make the payment by any of the following methods either

1.You can  pay by PayPal our id is imlp1960@gmail.com

2. Bank details for NEFT
 
Name of account                     Institute of Medico-Legal Publications Pvt Ltd
Bank                                         HDFC Bank
Branch                                      Sector-50, Noida-201 301
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Swift Code                                HDFCINBBDEL
 
Please quote the reference number. Email us the proof of deposit.( scan copy or photograph of the
slip of bank transfer)
Your acceptance letter would be sent after receipt of charges. 
After this no further amendment will be entertained in the manuscript
Note for authors - Please note that your submission is final and no further amendments would be
accepted in manuscript after issue of acceptance letter. You are hereby advised again to check
manuscript. Re submit file if corrections are there. New acceptance letter would not be issued to
change in authors sequence or affiliation
 
 
 
 
With warm regards
Yours sincerely

Prof R K Sharma
Editor, Indian Journal of Forensic Medicine & Toxicology
Former Head , Department of Forensic Medicine, A I I M S , New Delhi
http://medicopublication.com/index.php/ijfmt/index
www.ijfmt.com
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Dr R K Sharma
Editor, IJFMT
Institute of Medico-legal Publications
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On Mon, Mar 15, 2021 at 6:48 AM NarraSJ <service@narrasj.org> wrote:
Dear Dr Sharma, 
Editor-in-Chief
Indian Journal of Forensic Medicine and Toxicology
 
We would like to submit our review article entitled "Characteristics of Apparent Diffusion
Coefficient and Time Intensity Curve in Advanced Magnetic Resonance Imaging of Malignant
Soft Tissue Tumors" for publication in Indian Journal of Forensic Medicine and Toxicology. 

We attest to the fact that all authors listed contributed significantly to the work, have read the
manuscript, attested to the validity and legitimacy of the data and its interpretation, and agree to its
submission to  Indian Journal of Forensic Medicine and Toxicology. Our manuscript is not in the
process of submission in other journals. 
 
We hope that this letter can be considered for publication in Indian Journal of Forensic Medicine and
Toxicology. 

The full Cover Letter is attached herewith. 
 
Sincerely yours,
On behalf, 
Rosy Setiawati, MD
Department of Radiology, Medical Faculty, Airlangga University
Jl. Mayjen Prof. Dr. Moestopo No.47, Surabaya, Indonesia
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