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heny arwati <heny-a@fk.unair.ac.id>

Editor IJSCIA <ijsciaeditor@gmail.com> Tue, Feb 22, 2022 at 10:26 AM

To: heny-a@fk.unair.ac.id
Dear author,

Thank you for sending us your manuscript entitled: "Antimalarial activity of Virgin Coconut Oil against
Plasmodium berghei ANKA in mice".

We endeavor to let you know its status in the next few days (typically 1-4 days).
Best regards

Editor-in-Chief
International Journal of Scientific Advances (IJSCIA)

heny arwati <heny-a@fk.unair.ac.id> Tue, Feb 22, 2022 at 10:35 AM

To: bagus.widjanarko-2017@fk.unair.ac.id, bagusskm@gmail.com

[Quoted text hidden]

heny arwati <heny-a@fk.unair.ac.id> Wed, Feb 23, 2022 at 5:34 PM

To: magister.ikd@fk.unair.ac.id

------—--- Forwarded message ----—--—-

From: Editor IJSCIA <ijsciaeditor@gmail.com>

Date: Tue, Feb 22, 2022 at 10:26 AM

Subject: Acknowledgment of manuscript submission (ID: IJSCIA0285)
To: <heny-a@fk.unair.ac.id>

[Quoted text hidden]

Editor IJSCIA <ijsciaeditor@gmail.com> Fri, Feb 25, 2022 at 10:18 AM

To: heny-a@fk.unair.ac.id
Dear author,

Thank you for giving us the opportunity to consider your work.
Reviewers are recommending that your manuscript should be accepted. The following are their comments:

Reviewer #1: The rationale, methods, and results have a flow. The study owerall is thorough, robust, and well
discussed. It should be accepted
Reviewer #2: The authors have done justice to the subject matter, which is forthcoming and commendable.

Thank you for your fine contribution.

You now have the following actions to perform:

1. Should you need to make any improvement and other final checks on your manuscript, do so and revert back to us

for processing.

2. Pay the article processing fee using the inwice link or code herewith attached: https://www.paypal.com/invoice/p/#

K5YRRQKG6KRX24VTC

https://mail.g oogle.com/mail/u/0/?ik=c3e29d6d4e&view=pt&search=all &permthid=thread-f%3A1725432189424379307&simpl=msg-f%3A172543218942437 ...
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Do not forget to immediately send the proof to us (ijsciaeditor@gmail.com).

Your article would be published online in the current issue once this has been
done.

Warm regards
[Quoted text hidden]

ﬂ Invoice - 0016.pdf
72K

heny arwati <heny-a@fk.unair.ac.id> Fri, Feb 25, 2022 at 1:15 PM

To: Editor IJSCIA <ijsciaeditor@gmail.com>

Dear editor,
Thank you very much for the acceptance of our manuscript.
We will do so as your suggestion and send it back to you as soon as possible.

Best regards.
On behalf of all authors

Heny.
[Quoted text hidden]

heny arwati <heny-a@fk.unair.ac.id> Fri, Feb 25, 2022 at 1:15 PM

To: bagus widjanarko <bagus.widjanarko-2017@fk.unair.ac.id>, bagusskm@gmail.com

------—--- Forwarded message ----—---—-

From: Editor IJSCIA <ijsciaeditor@gmail.com>

Date: Fri, Feb 25, 2022 at 10:18 AM

Subject: Re: Acknowledgment of manuscript submission (ID: IJSCIA0285)
To: <heny-a@fk.unair.ac.id>

[Quoted text hidden]

ﬂ Invoice - 0016.pdf
72K

heny arwati <heny-a@fk.unair.ac.id> Mon, Mar 28, 2022 at 8:30 PM

To: Editor IJSCIA <ijsciaeditor@gmail.com>

Dear editor,

Herewith, | would like to inform you that | have paid the invoice for the publication fee for paper entitled: Antimalarial
activity of Virgin Coconut Oil against Plasmodium berghei ANKA in mice. Authors: Bagus Widjanarko, Puspa
Wardhani, Heny Arwati.

On behalf of all authors, we apologize for the late payment due to a problem with the credit card.

Please find attached the paid inwice.

After this, hopefully, our paper will be published soon.

Your kind attention is highly appreciated.

Best regards,
on behalf of all authors

Heny.
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https://mail.g oogle.com/mail/u/0/?ik=c3e29d6d4e&view=pt&search=all &permthid=thread-f%3A1725432189424379307&simpl=msg-f%3A172543218942437 ...

213


mailto:ijsciaeditor@gmail.com
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=c3e29d6d4e&view=att&th=17f2ee37e67f20a3&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=f_l01uhgql0&safe=1&zw
mailto:ijsciaeditor@gmail.com
mailto:heny-a@fk.unair.ac.id
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=c3e29d6d4e&view=att&th=17f2f853d0f81934&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=f_l01uhgql0&safe=1&zw
mailto:ijsciaeditor@gmail.com

9/11/22, 12:08 PM Airlangga University Mail - Acknowiedgment of manuscript submission (ID: IJSCIA0285)
[Quoted text hidden]

ﬂ Invoice - 0016.pdf
74K

Editor IJSCIA <ijsciaeditor@gmail.com> Mon, Mar 28, 2022 at 8:49 PM
To: heny arwati <heny-a@fk.unair.ac.id>
Dear author,

This is noted with thanks.
You will be duly informed once your paper is published.

Best regards
[Quoted text hidden]

heny arwati <heny-a@fk.unair.ac.id> Mon, Mar 28, 2022 at 9:02 PM
To: Editor IJSCIA <ijsciaeditor@gmail.com>

Dear editor,
Please find the attached revised manuscript prior to publication.
Thank you very much for publishing our paper.

Best regards,
on behalf of all authors

Heny.
[Quoted text hidden]
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