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Anvpublications@anvpublication.org <Anvpublications@anvpublication.org> Mon, Mar 2, 2020 at 8:17 PM
To: "monsteredans@gmail.com; siswandono@ff.unair.ac.id; triwidiandani@gmail.com;" <rr-retno-w@ff.unair.ac.id>

Research Journal of Pharmacy and Technology
Paper ID: 20210202656930894      Date of Submission: 10-Feb-2020
Paper Title:    Structure Modifications of Pinostrobin from Temu Kunci (Boesenbergia pandurata ROXB.
SCHLECHT) and Their Analgesic Activity Based on in Silico Studies
Authors:    Andy Suryadi; Siswandono Siswodihardjo; Tri Widiandani; Retno Widyowati

Dear Author(s),

Thanks for submission of paper at enlisted journals of ‘A & V Publications’. In the manuscript, it is compulsory to
cite references of the related articles from journals of A&V Publications. Therefore, we are requested you to kindly
cite / refers at least ten published manuscript from the enlisted journals. The link of published articles is embedded
at the bottom of this mail, which you would to click and select any ten manuscripts as applicable to the submitted
manuscript. 

After citing the related articles, please resubmit the revised manuscript at article submission portal within 7 days.

Click here to view the simalar works as yours. 

Please Login to account from which you have submitted the article, for more details. (Click Here to Login Now. ) 

Thanks for your kind submission of manuscript. 

Editor 
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Research Journal of Pharmacy and Technology
Paper ID: 20210202656930894      Date of Submission: 10-Feb-2020
Paper Title:    Structure Modifications of Pinostrobin from Temu Kunci (Boesenbergia pandurata ROXB.
SCHLECHT) and Their Analgesic Activity Based on in Silico Studies
Authors:    Andy Suryadi; Siswandono Siswodihardjo; Tri Widiandani; Retno Widyowati

Dear Author(s),

Editorial board has concidered your article titled ''Structure Modifications of Pinostrobin from Temu Kunci
(Boesenbergia pandurata ROXB. SCHLECHT) and Their Analgesic Activity Based on in Silico Studies''. for
publication in up-comming issue.You are requested to send the final version of your article by clearly mentioning
the Paper Title and Author(s) name, affiliation and email address in proper sequence. 

Note:- Please submit the final version of article with in 7 Days. 

Please Login to account from which you have submitted the article for more details. (To login now click :
http://www.anvpublication.org/Subscribed_User_Login.aspx) 

Thank you.

Editor

This is auto generated mail. Please do not reply.

rr retno widyowati <rr-retno-w@ff.unair.ac.id> Wed, Jun 3, 2020 at 7:22 AM
To: Anvpublications@anvpublication.org

How should I pay for the submission article? In the website I only found information that was submitted to the
Research Journal of Pharmacy and Technology with payment order No. 2020531130133067777929420. What
kind of bank and how to pay?

Best regards,

Retno Widyowati, Phd
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To: Anvpublications@anvpublication.org

I already paid for the article ... please process for publication.

Thank you

On Sat, May 30, 2020 at 9:37 PM <Anvpublications@anvpublication.org> wrote:
[Quoted text hidden]
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rr retno widyowati <rr-retno-w@ff.unair.ac.id>

Payment detailes for your submitted article is verified successfully.
2 messages

Anvpublications@anvpublication.org <Anvpublications@anvpublication.org> Mon, Aug 31, 2020 at 11:14 PM
To: rr-retno-w@ff.unair.ac.id

Dear Sir/Madam,
Regards,

Thanks for submitting your article. It is our great pleasure to inform you that, payment proof for your submitted
article (PID: 20210202656930894 ) is verified by the publisher. 

Please Login to your account from which you have submitted the article for more details. (Click Here to Login Now
) 

Thanking you.
Editor-in-Chief

This is auto generated mail. Please do not reply.

rr retno widyowati <rr-retno-w@ff.unair.ac.id> Mon, Nov 2, 2020 at 11:34 AM
To: Anvpublications@anvpublication.org

How is my paper publication ... I already paid and when will this paper be published? 
Paper ID: 20210202656930894 
Title: Structure Modifications of Pinostrobin from Temu Kunci (Boesenbergia pandurata ROXB. SCHLECHT) and
Their Analgesic Activity Based on in Silico Studies 
Authors: Andy Suryadi; Siswandono Siswodihardjo; Tri Widiandani; Retno Widyowati 
(monsteredans@gmail.com; siswandono@ff.unair.ac.id; triwidiandani@gmail.com; rr-retno-
w@ff.unair.ac.id) 
Submitted To: Research Journal of Pharmacy and Technology 
Payment Transaction No. :   pay_FUXsWsFD5MFXBT    
Paid On :  8/24/2020 12:00:00 AM 
When will this article be published?

Best Regards,

Retno Widyowati, PhD
[Quoted text hidden]

http://www.anvpublication.org/Subscribed_User_Login.aspx
mailto:monsteredans@gmail.com
mailto:siswandono@ff.unair.ac.id
mailto:triwidiandani@gmail.com
mailto:rr-retno-w@ff.unair.ac.id


17/04/23 04.04Airlangga University Mail - (no subject)

Page 1 of 3https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ik=cd5e19a882&view=pt&search…l=msg-a:r-4049531352782133977&simpl=msg-f:1697642885165273507

rr retno widyowati <rr-retno-w@ff.unair.ac.id>

(no subject)
5 messages

Research Journal of Pharmacy and Technology Monika Daharwal
<editor.rjpt@gmail.com>

Sun, Apr 18, 2021 at 1:26
PM

To: a.muthi@ung.ac.id, prof.sis@ff.unair.ac.id, tri widiandani <tri-w@ff.unair.ac.id>, rr-retno-w@ff.unair.ac.id

Dear Author,
Regards
The submitted manuscript is ready for publication in Research Journal of Pharmacy and Technology
(RJPT) Vol. 14 Issue 04, April 2021.
 

The gallery proof of the paper is attaching herewith for any necessary correction if required, please
convey by E. Mail as in the attached format before April 26, 2021.
 

Thanking you,
Yours truly,
 
Editor
 
Gallery Proof of published article in RJPT _14 _ 04 _ 2021.

-- 
Editor,
Research Journal of Pharmacy and Technology,
RJPT House, Lokmanya Grih Nirman Society, 
Rohanipuram, In-front of Sector- 1, 
Pt. Deendayal Upadhyay Nagar, 
Raipur 492 010. (CG) India.
Phone No. +919406051618

www.ajrconline.org

www.anvpublication.org

www.rjptonline.org

www.asianpharmaonline.org <http://www.asianpharmapress.org>
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rr retno widyowati <rr-retno-w@ff.unair.ac.id> Sun, Apr 18, 2021 at 8:16 PM
To: Research Journal of Pharmacy and Technology Monika Daharwal <editor.rjpt@gmail.com>

Dear Editor RJPT,

Regards.... Our manuscript which will be published in the Journal of Pharmaceutical and Technology Research
(RJPT) vol 14 issue 04, there are minor changes in corresponding author (only rr-retno-w@ff.unair.ac.id) and
affiliation of Department of Pharmaceutical Chemistry become Department of Pharmaceutical Sciences
(Siswandono S, Tri W, Retno W)
 
Thank you, we are waiting for the publication of this articles.

Best regards,

Retno Widyowati, PhD
Department of Pharmaceutical Sciences
Faculty of Pharmacy Universitas Airlangga
Surabaya

[Quoted text hidden]
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Research Journal of Pharmacy and Technology Monika Daharwal
<editor.rjpt@gmail.com>
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PM

To: rr retno widyowati <rr-retno-w@ff.unair.ac.id>

plz find attachement
[Quoted text hidden]
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rr retno widyowati <rr-retno-w@ff.unair.ac.id> Tue, Apr 20, 2021 at 4:11 AM
To: Research Journal of Pharmacy and Technology Monika Daharwal <editor.rjpt@gmail.com>

Dear Editor RJPT,

Thank you very much ... everything is ok now.
It is an honor for us that can contribute to your journal.

Best regards,

Retno Widyowati, PhD
[Quoted text hidden]
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Research Journal of Pharmacy and Technology Monika Daharwal
<editor.rjpt@gmail.com>

Wed, Apr 21, 2021 at 4:46
PM

To: rr retno widyowati <rr-retno-w@ff.unair.ac.id>

Dear Author,
Thanks for information.  We hope the submission of manuscript in future too.
Editor
[Quoted text hidden]


