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Mochamad Zakki Fahmi <m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id> Sat, Jan 26, 2019 at 9:05 AM
To: pop_al.mihai@yahoo.com

[January 25th, 2019]

Mihai Popescu
Editor-In-Chief
Digest Journal of Nanomaterials and Biostructures

Dear Prof. Popescu:

I would like to submit an Article, titled “DESIGN OF CELLULOSA ACETATE-COLLAGEN NANOFIBER
AND ITS IN VITRO ASSESSMENT AS WOUND DRESSING CANDIDATE”, for consideration for publication
as full paper in Digest Journal of Nanomaterials and Biostructures (word count: 4.032; figures 9; references 21).
The paper was co-authored by Muhammad Fathan Dzikri, Tri Prasetyo Armedya, Yanuardi Raharjo, Satya Candra
Wibawa Sakti, and Puwanti

In this study, we prepared nanofiber composite membrane of cellulose acetate and collagen via electrospinning.
Optimization of electrospinning process was reached by varying flow rate and design of collector. Further
characterization of obtained the membrane was furnished with SEM-EDX and mechanical characterizations. By
this observation we found that composite nanofiber with flat collector performed highest tensile strength value
compared with modified (citric acid and heating treatment membrane). Cytotoxicity evaluation of the membrane
reveals that all of membranes are non-toxic and suitable for clinical application.

We believe that the findings of this study are relevant to the scope of your journal and will be of interest to its
readership. This manuscript has not been published or presented elsewhere in part or in entirety, and is not under
consideration by another journal. All the authors have approved the manuscript and agree with submission to your
esteemed journal. There are no conflicts of interest to be declared.

Thank you for your consideration. We hope our manuscript is suitable for publication in your journal.

Best Regards,

Mochamad Zakki Fahmi, Ph.D (3RZRE)
Assistant Professor, Departement of Chemistry
Universitas Airlangga

Phone : +62-838-32901697

Email : m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id

[+ [m]
[=]

2 attachments

ﬂ cover_letter by M.Z. Fahmi.pdf
106K


mailto:m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/6?ui=2&ik=a3968282e0&view=att&th=16887e7619a13847&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=f_jrcty64q0&safe=1&zw

] Manuscript.docx
1991K

MIHAI POPESCU <pop_al.mihai@yahoo.com> Sun, Feb 3, 2019 at 4:23 PM
Reply-To: MIHAI POPESCU <pop_al.mihai@yahoo.com>
To: Mochamad Zakki Fahmi <m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id>

Dear author,

This is a confirmation that we have received your submitted article for publication in DJNB.
After evaluation you will be informed if it is accepted for publication and you will receive a
confirmation email together with a copyright statement and a proforma invoice for the payment
of the publication tax. From receiving the paper it usually takes about three months for
acknowledgement of acceptance for publication or not.

Thank you for submitting your paper to our journal,
Editorial Team

Digest Journal of Nanomaterials and Biostructures
Chalcogenide Letters

Journal of Ovonic Research

Journal of Optoelectronic and Biomedical Materials

Journal of Non - Oxide Glasses

[Quoted text hidden]

Mochamad Zakki Fahmi <m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id> Thu, Feb 21, 2019 at 12:36 PM
To: MIHAI POPESCU <pop_al.mihai@yahoo.com>

Dear Prof. Popescu,

Is there any update for my submission? thank you.
Best Regards,

Mochamad Zakki Fahmi, Ph.D GESRE)

Assistant Professor, Departement of Chemistry

Universitas Airlangga

Phone : +62-838-32901697

Email : m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id
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Mochamad Zakki Fahmi <m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id> Thu, Oct 17, 2019 at 10:33 AM
To: ahmadi jaya permana <ahmadi-j-permana@fst.unair.ac.id>
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Best Regards,

Mochamad Zakki Fahmi, Ph.D (3RZ3E)
Assistant Professor, Departement of Chemistry
Airlangga University

Phone : +62-838-32901697

Email : m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id
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Copy proof of accepted paper for publication
7 messages

Virtual Company of Physics <marketing@chalcogen.ro> Thu, Mar 14, 2019 at 4:48 PM
To: Mochamad Zakki Fahmi <m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id>

Dear author,

We have received your transfer concerning the publication fee, you can find attached the copy proof of the paper
accepted for publication.

Please send it back after the required modifications(if necessary),together with the copyright form.

You also have attached the invoice regarding the transfer you have just made.

Best Regards,

Virtual Company of Physics
Technical Manager and Marketing
Dr. I. D. Simandan

On 13-Mar-19 15:54, Mochamad Zakki Fahmi wrote:
Thank you, | got and paid it

On Wed, 13 Mar 2019 at 17.28 Virtual Company of Physics <marketing@chalcogen.ro> wrote:

Dear author,

We have send you the electronic link for payment. The e-mail is from a PayPal address not from my
e-mail address. Please also check your spam folder.

Virtual Company of Physics
Technical Manager and Marketing
Dr. I.D. Simandan

On 13-Mar-19 09:10, Mochamad Zakki Fahmi wrote:

Dear
Yes | prefer credit card

On Wed, 13 Mar 2019 at 13.56 Virtual Company of Physics
<marketing@chalcogen.ro> wrote:
Dear author,

You will receive a email from PayPal service with the transfer request in the name of
Virtual Company of Physics for the transfer of the publication tax regarding your
accepted article for publication.

The transfer charges for the online electronic transfer will be included in the final fee
requested ( * 5.2% + 3 EURO is the PayPal transfer fee per transaction).

Please reply if you wish to transfer the publication fee by credit/debit card to send
you the link for payment.

Virtual Company of Physics
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Technical Manager and Marketing
Dr. I.D. Simandan

On 12-Mar-19 22:39, MIHAI POPESCU wrote:

----- Forwarded Message -----

From: Mochamad Zakki Fahmi
<m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id>

To: MIHAI POPESCU <pop_al.mihai@yahoo.com>
Sent: Monday, March 11, 2019, 5:54:44 AM GMT+2
Subject: Re: Fw: Proforma Invoice and Copyright
statement for the accepted article for publication

Sorry form my unclear word on previous email. | just
prefer to transfer via credit card and need your guideline
for this way.

Moreover, is this any final proofing for my manuscript?
Because | plan to change my co-author name. Thank
you

On Mon, 11 Mar 2019 at 10.37 Mochamad Zakki Fahmi
<m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id> wrote:
Dear Prof Popescu,

Thank you for the email. | prefer patennya via credit
card, please inform me
guideline for this. Thank you

On Mon, 11 Mar 2019 at 02.04 MIHAI POPESCU
<pop_al.mihai@yahoo.com> wrote:

----- Forwarded Message -----

From: Virtual Company of Physics
<marketing@chalcogen.ro>

To: MIHAI POPESCU <pop_al.mihai@yahoo.com>
Sent: Monday, March 4, 2019, 9:40:49 AM GMT+2
Subject: Fwd: Proforma Invoice and Copyright
statement for the accepted article for publication

-------- Forwarded Message --------
Subject;Proforma Invoice and Copyright statement for the
accepted article for publication
Date:Thu, 28 Feb 2019 12:43:06 +0200
From:Virtual Company of Physics
<marketing@chalcogen.ro>
To:Muhammad.fathan.dzikri-17 @fst.unair.ac.id

Dear author,

Your paper has been accepted for publication. You can find
attached the copyright form which must be sent back filled in and
the proforma invoice for the payment of the publication tax.
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Only wire transfer is accepted at one of the accounts specified in
the Proforma Invoice to Beneficiary: "Virtual Company of
Physics".

Please specify in sender® and description(details)** fields of the
bank transfer form:

* customer name, affiliation and personal address;

** number and date of the received Proforma Invoice.

If you do not specify this details, we can not link the bank transfer
to you hence the article will not be published and the transfer tax
will be unidentified, blocked and returned to the sender's bank.

The proforma invoice is available one month starting with it's issue
date. Your paper will be visible on the main site only after the
publication tax will be paid, otherwise after one month the
proforma invoice will be cancelled and your paper will be
automatically rejected.

May I remind you that as specified on the proforma invoice, the
BANK CHARGES FOR WIRE TRANSFER ARE SUPPORTED
BY THE CUSTOMER !

Our bank does not have any charges for incoming transfers, the
charges are deducted by the senders bank and by an intermediary
bank (if it is the case of such bank), you must ask at your local
bank the fees for the transfer(your bank and intermediary bank).
On the payment instructions form you have 3 options BEN, SHA,
OUR on "Details of Charges" field, there you must selected OUR
(OUR instruction means you will pay all the transfer charges. We
will receive all your payment).

Debit/Credit Card transfer is also available through online
electronic payment. Please request this option if it is more suitable
for you compared to wire transfer. You can pay in any currency, the
conversion from your currency to USD or EURO is made
automatically by the system. The transfer charges for the online
electronic payment are included in the final publication fee
requested.

Best Regards,

Virtual Company of Physics
Technical Manager and Marketing
Dr. I. D. Simandan

Best Regards,

Mochamad Zakki Fahmi, Ph.D (3E3RH)
Assistant Professor, Departement of Chemistry
Airlangga University

Phone : +62-838-32901697

Email : m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id

Best Regards,

Mochamad Zakki Fahmi, Ph.D (5R3RH)
Assistant Professor, Departement of Chemistry
Airlangga University

Phone : +62-838-32901697

Email : m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id

Best Regards,
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Mochamad Zakki Fahmi, Ph.D (5R3H)

Assistant Professor, Departement of Chemistry

Airlangga University
Phone : +62-838-32901697
Email : m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id

Best Regards,

Mochamad Zakki Fahmi, Ph.D (3R2%H.)
Assistant Professor, Departement of Chemistry
Airlangga University

Phone : +62-838-32901697

Email : m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id
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Mochamad Zakki Fahmi <m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id>
To: Virtual Company of Physics <marketing@chalcogen.ro>

Fri, Mar 15, 2019 at 3:04 PM

Please find the attached file for proofed manuscript and copyright transfer Statement.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Mochamad Zakki Fahmi, Ph.D (Sﬁﬁﬁ)
Assistant Professor, Departement of Chemistry
Universitas Airlangga

Phone : +62-838-32901697

Email : m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id
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Virtual Company of Physics <marketing@chalcogen.ro>

To: Mochamad Zakki Fahmi <m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id>

Dear author,

We have received you final form of the paper.
The paper will be posted online in a couple of days.

Best regards,

Virtual Company of Physics
Technical Manager and Marketing
Dr. I. D. Simandan

Fri, Mar 15, 2019 at 4:57 PM
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Mochamad Zakki Fahmi <m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id>
To: Virtual Company of Physics <marketing@chalcogen.ro>

Thank you

Best Regards,

Mochamad Zakki Fahmi, Ph.D GRRE)
Assistant Professor, Departement of Chemistry
Universitas Airlangga

Phone : +62-838-32901697

Email : m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id
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Virtual Company of Physics <marketing@chalcogen.ro>
To: Mochamad Zakki Fahmi <m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id>

Dear author,.
What is the full name of author NASRONUDIN ?

The name of the authors must be as specified next:

Mon, Mar 18, 2019 at 9:30 AM

Mon, Mar 18, 2019 at 2:15 PM

The forename (first name) and second name (middle name) must be just a letter and only the last name
(surname/family name) must be written in full, as in this example: FirstName MiddleName LastName = F. M.

Lastname
Please send us the names of the authors as specified.

Regards.
[Quoted text hidden]
Mochamad Zakki Fahmi <m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id>

To: Virtual Company of Physics <marketing@chalcogen.ro>

The full Author I listed below:

1. MUHAMAD FATHAN DZIKRI = M.F. DZIKRI

2. TRI PRASETYO ARMEDYA = T.P. ARMEDYA

3. SITI QOMARIYAH KHATIRUNISA = S.Q. KHAIRUNNISA
4. SATYA CANDRA WIBAWA SAKTI = S.C.W. SAKTI

5. YANUARDI RAHARJO = Y. RAHARJO

6. WULAN PURNAMASARI = W. PURNAMASARI

7. NASRONUDIN NASRONUDIN = N. NASRONUDIN

Thank you

Best Regards,

Mochamad Zakki Fahmi, Ph.D (3RZRE)
Assistant Professor, Departement of Chemistry
Universitas Airlangga

Phone : +62-838-32901697

Mon, Mar 18, 2019 at 4:47 PM
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Email : m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id
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Mochamad Zakki Fahmi <m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id> Sat, Mar 23, 2019 at 8:35 AM
To: Virtual Company of Physics <marketing@chalcogen.ro>

Dear Dr. Simandan,
There are a word mistake on title of my paper, namely, “Cellulosa” should be change with “Cellulose”. Could you

change it? Thank you
[Quoted text hidden]
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Mochamad Zakki <m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id>

Copy proof of accepted paper for publication

Virtual Company of Physics <marketing@chalcogen.ro> Thu, Mar 14, 2019 at 4:48 PM
To: Mochamad Zakki Fahmi <m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id>

Dear author,

We have received your transfer concerning the publication fee, you can find attached the copy proof of the paper accepted for
publication.

Please send it back after the required modifications(if necessary),together with the copyright form.

You also have attached the invoice regarding the transfer you have just made.

Best Regards,

Virtual Company of Physics
Technical Manager and Marketing
Dr. I. D. Simandan

On 13-Mar-19 15:54, Mochamad Zakki Fahmi wrote:
Thank you, | got and paid it

On Wed, 13 Mar 2019 at 17.28 Virtual Company of Physics <marketing@chalcogen.ro> wrote:

Dear author,

We have send you the electronic link for payment. The e-mail is from a PayPal address not from my e-mail
address. Please also check your spam folder.

Virtual Company of Physics
Technical Manager and Marketing
Dr. I.D. Simandan

On 13-Mar-19 09:10, Mochamad Zakki Fahmi wrote:

Dear
Yes | prefer credit card

On Wed, 13 Mar 2019 at 13.56 Virtual Company of Physics <marketing@chalcogen.ro> wrote:
Dear author,

You will receive a email from PayPal service with the transfer request in the name of Virtual
Company of Physics for the transfer of the publication tax regarding your accepted article for
publication.

The transfer charges for the online electronic transfer will be included in the final fee requested ( *
5.2% + 3 EURO is the PayPal transfer fee per transaction).

Please reply if you wish to transfer the publication fee by credit/debit card to send you the link for
payment.

Virtual Company of Physics
Technical Manager and Marketing
Dr. I.D. Simandan
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mailto:marketing@chalcogen.ro
mailto:marketing@chalcogen.ro
mailto:marketing@chalcogen.ro

On 12-Mar-19 22:39, MIHAI POPESCU wrote:

----- Forwarded Message -----

From: Mochamad Zakki Fahmi <m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id>
To: MIHAI POPESCU <pop_al.mihai@yahoo.com>

Sent: Monday, March 11, 2019, 5:54:44 AM GMT+2

Subject: Re: Fw: Proforma Invoice and Copyright statement for the
accepted article for publication

Sorry form my unclear word on previous email. | just prefer to
transfer via credit card and need your guideline for this way.

Moreover, is this any final proofing for my manuscript? Because |
plan to change my co-author name. Thank you

On Mon, 11 Mar 2019 at 10.37 Mochamad Zakki Fahmi
<m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id> wrote:
Dear Prof Popescu,

Thank you for the email. | prefer patennya via credit card, please
inform me
guideline for this. Thank you

On Mon, 11 Mar 2019 at 02.04 MIHAI POPESCU
<pop_al.mihai@yahoo.com> wrote:

----- Forwarded Message -----

From: Virtual Company of Physics <marketing@chalcogen.ro>
To: MIHAI POPESCU <pop_al.mihai@yahoo.com>

Sent: Monday, March 4, 2019, 9:40:49 AM GMT+2

Subject: Fwd: Proforma Invoice and Copyright statement for the
accepted article for publication

———————— Forwarded Message --------
Subject:Proforma Invoice and Copyright statement for the accepted article
for publication
Date:Thu, 28 Feb 2019 12:43:06 +0200

From:Virtual Company of Physics <marketing@chalcogen.ro>
To:Muhammad.fathan.dzikri-17 @fst.unair.ac.id

Dear author,

Your paper has been accepted for publication. You can find
attached the copyright form which must be sent back filled
in and the proforma invoice for the payment of the
publication tax.

Only wire transfer is accepted at one of the accounts
specified in the Proforma Invoice to Beneficiary: "Virtual
Company of Physics".

Please specify in sender* and description(details)** fields
of the bank transfer form:

* customer name, affiliation and personal address;

** number and date of the received Proforma Invoice.

If you do not specify this details, we can not link the
bank transfer to you hence the article will not be
published and the transfer tax will be unidentified,
blocked and returned to the sender's bank.

The proforma invoice is available one month starting with
it's issue date. Your paper will be visible on the main
site only after the publication tax will be paid, otherwise
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after one month the proforma invoice will be cancelled and
your paper will be automatically rejected.

May I remind you that as specified on the proforma invoice,
the BANK CHARGES FOR WIRE TRANSFER ARE SUPPORTED BY THE
CUSTOMER !

Our bank does not have any charges for incoming transfers,
the charges are deducted by the senders bank and by an
intermediary bank (if it is the case of such bank), you
must ask at your local bank the fees for the transfer(your
bank and intermediary bank). On the payment instructions
form you have 3 options BEN, SHA, OUR on "Details of
Charges" field, there you must selected OUR (OUR
instruction means you will pay all the transfer charges. We
will receive all your payment).

Debit/Credit Card transfer is also available through online
electronic payment. Please request this option if it is
more suitable for you compared to wire transfer. You can
pay in any currency, the conversion from your currency to
USD or EURO is made automatically by the system. The
transfer charges for the online electronic payment are
included in the final publication fee requested.

Best Regards,

Virtual Company of Physics
Technical Manager and Marketing
Dr. I. D. Simandan

Best Regards,

Mochamad Zakki Fahmi, Ph.D (3RH)
Assistant Professor, Departement of Chemistry
Airlangga University

Phone : +62-838-32901697

Email : m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id

Best Regards,

Mochamad Zakki Fahmi, Ph.D (3RH)
Assistant Professor, Departement of Chemistry
Airlangga University

Phone : +62-838-32901697

Email : m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id

Best Regards,

Mochamad Zakki Fahmi, Ph.D (5R2%EL)
Assistant Professor, Departement of Chemistry
Airlangga University

Phone : +62-838-32901697

Email : m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id

Best Regards,

Mochamad Zakki Fahmi, Ph.D (3RZ%EL)
Assistant Professor, Departement of Chemistry
Airlangga University

Phone : +62-838-32901697

Email : m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id
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Fw: Proforma Invoice and Copyright statement for the accepted article for

publication
7 messages

MIHAI POPESCU <pop_al.mihai@yahoo.com> Mon, Mar 11, 2019 at 2:03 AM
Reply-To: MIHAI POPESCU <pop_al.mihai@yahoo.com>
To: "m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id" <m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id>

----- Forwarded Message -----

From: Virtual Company of Physics <marketing@chalcogen.ro>

To: MIHAI POPESCU <pop_al.mihai@yahoo.com>

Sent: Monday, March 4, 2019, 9:40:49 AM GMT+2

Subject: Fwd: Proforma Invoice and Copyright statement for the accepted article for publication

-------- Forwarded Message --------
Subject:Proforma Invoice and Copyright statement for the accepted article for publication
Date:Thu, 28 Feb 2019 12:43:06 +0200
From:Virtual Company of Physics <marketing@chalcogen.ro>
To:Muhammad.fathan.dzikri-17@fst.unair.ac.id

Dear author,

Your paper has been accepted for publication. You can find attached the copyright form which must be sent back filled
in and the proforma invoice for the payment of the publication tax.

Only wire transfer is accepted at one of the accounts specified in the Proforma Invoice to Beneficiary: "Virtual
Company of Physics".

Please specify in sender® and description(details)** fields of the bank transfer form:

* customer name, affiliation and personal address;

** number and date of the received Proforma Invoice.

If you do not specify this details, we can not link the bank transfer to you hence the article will not be published and the
transfer tax will be unidentified, blocked and returned to the sender's bank.

The proforma invoice is available one month starting with it's issue date. Your paper will be visible on the main site only
after the publication tax will be paid, otherwise after one month the proforma invoice will be cancelled and your paper
will be automatically rejected.

May I remind you that as specified on the proforma invoice, the BANK CHARGES FOR WIRE TRANSFER ARE
SUPPORTED BY THE CUSTOMER !

Our bank does not have any charges for incoming transfers, the charges are deducted by the senders bank and by an
intermediary bank (if it is the case of such bank), you must ask at your local bank the fees for the transfer(your bank and
intermediary bank). On the payment instructions form you have 3 options BEN, SHA, OUR on "Details of Charges"
field, there you must selected OUR (OUR instruction means you will pay all the transfer charges. We will receive all
your payment).

Debit/Credit Card transfer is also available through online electronic payment. Please request this option if it is more
suitable for you compared to wire transfer. You can pay in any currency, the conversion from your currency to USD or
EURO is made automatically by the system. The transfer charges for the online electronic payment are included in the
final publication fee requested.

Best Regards,

Virtual Company of Physics
Technical Manager and Marketing
Dr. I. D. Simandan
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Mochamad Zakki Fahmi <m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id> Mon, Mar 11, 2019 at 10:37 AM
To: MIHAI POPESCU <pop_al.mihai@yahoo.com>

Dear Prof Popescu,

Thank you for the email. | prefer patennya via credit card, please inform me
guideline for this. Thank you
[Quoted text hidden]

Best Regards,

Mochamad Zakki Fahmi, Ph.D (3R2%EL)
Assistant Professor, Departement of Chemistry
Airlangga University

Phone : +62-838-32901697

Email : m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id

Mochamad Zakki Fahmi <m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id> Mon, Mar 11, 2019 at 10:54 AM
To: MIHAI POPESCU <pop_al.mihai@yahoo.com>

Sorry form my unclear word on previous email. | just prefer to transfer via credit card and need your guideline for this
way.

Moreover, is this any final proofing for my manuscript? Because | plan to change my co-author name. Thank you
[Quoted text hidden]

Virtual Company of Physics <marketing@chalcogen.ro> Wed, Mar 13, 2019 at 1:55 PM
To: Muhammad.fathan.dzikri-17 @fst.unair.ac.id
Cc: m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id

Dear author,

You will receive a email from PayPal service with the transfer request in the name of Virtual Company of Physics for
the transfer of the publication tax regarding your accepted article for publication.

The transfer charges for the online electronic transfer will be included in the final fee requested ( * 5.2% + 3 EURO is
the PayPal transfer fee per transaction).

Please reply if you wish to transfer the publication fee by credit/debit card to send you the link for payment.

Virtual Company of Physics
Technical Manager and Marketing
Dr. I.D. Simandan

[Quoted text hidden]

Mochamad Zakki Fahmi <m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id> Wed, Mar 13, 2019 at 2:10 PM
To: Virtual Company of Physics <marketing@chalcogen.ro>

Dear

Yes | prefer credit card
[Quoted text hidden]
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Virtual Company of Physics <marketing@chalcogen.ro> Wed, Mar 13, 2019 at 5:27 PM
To: Mochamad Zakki Fahmi <m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id>

Dear author,

We have send you the electronic link for payment. The e-mail is from a PayPal address not from my e-mail address.
Please also check your spam folder.

Virtual Company of Physics

Technical Manager and Marketing
Dr. I.D. Simandan

[Quoted text hidden]

Mochamad Zakki Fahmi <m.zakki.fahmi@fst.unair.ac.id> Wed, Mar 13, 2019 at 8:54 PM
To: Virtual Company of Physics <marketing@chalcogen.ro>

Thank you, | got and paid it
[Quoted text hidden]
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