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Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> Wed, Mar 31, 2021 at 1:22 PM
To: Melly Susanti <mellyphua@gmail.com>, yusuf_505@fk.unair.ac.id

Melly Susanti Phua, Mochamad Yusuf Alsagaff, Mochammad Thaha, Christian Jonatan:

We have reached a decision regarding your submission to Pharmacognosy Journal, "Inotropes in
Chronic Beta-Blocker Therapy".

Our decision is to: Accept Submission

The review is very interesting, well-written and good organized, however, the references have
to be updated as most of which are a little bit old.

Publication Charges - USD 650 We request you to confirm your mode of payment 1) Credit
Card or 2) Bank Transfer. An invoice can be raised accordingly.

Awaiting your response.

Regards,
Emily Flora

On Mon, Jan 18, 2021 at 10:15 PM Melly Susanti <mellyphua@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ms. Emily Flora,
Thank you for the acceptance. | look forward to hearing from you
Best regards,
Melly, MD
On Mon, 18 Jan 2021 at 21.50 Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Dr. Melly,

Thanks for your email. We accept your request for this time. Soon, we will get back to you
with the review comments.

Regards,
Emily Flora

On Mon, Jan 18, 2021 at 12:11 PM Melly Susanti <mellyphua@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ms. Emily Flora,

Thank you for your prompt response. Previously, | was charged 700 USD for publication charges. Due to
current difficult time in a pandemic, I'm hoping you may kindly reduce the charges to 650 USD. | sincerely
appreciate your time and consideration and looking forward to hearing from you.

Sincerely,

Melly Susanti, MD

On Mon, 18 Jan 2021 at 13.17 Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> wrote:
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Dear Mochamad Yusuf Alsagaff,

Thank you very much for your submission to Pharmacognosy Journal. We have received
your article entitled " Inotropes in Chronic Beta-Blocker Therapy”. The article is now
under our PRELIMINARY EVALUATION and we will keep you updated on the article
status accordingly.

As we are an open-access non-profit organization, we require publication charges to
recover our editorial and production expenses. They cover the range of publishing
services we provide which includes the provision of online tools for editors and authors,
article production and hosting, liaison with abstracting and indexing services, and
customer services. The publication charges are 899 USD for the accepted article. You are
required to process with publication charges upon acceptance of your article (after peer-
review). Kindly confirm your response to proceed with the review process.

We thank you for submitting your valuable work to the Pharmacognosy Journal.

Kindly get back to us for further queries.

Have a great day.!

Best regards,

Emily Flora

Managing Editor

Pharmacognosy Journal

ISSN: 0975-3575
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