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hamdan Muhammad <muhammad.hamdan@fk.unair.ac.id>

Manuscript Received & Peer Review Acceptance -PJ-23-1153

Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> 10 Februari 2023 pukul 17.17
Kepada: muhammad.hamdan@fk.unair.ac.id, romdhoni-a-c@fk.unair.ac.id

On Thu, Feb 9, 2023 at 12:05 PM Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Dr. Muhammad Hamdan',
 
Thank you very much for your submission to the Pharmacognosy Journal. We have
received your article entitled "Effect of Thiamine on Serum Glutamate in Ischemic
Stroke Animal Model”. The article is now under our PRELIMINARY EVALUATION
and we will keep you updated on the article status accordingly.

As we are an open-access non-profit organization, we require publication charges to
recover our editorial and production expenses. They cover the range of publishing
services we provide which includes the provision of online tools for editors and authors,
article production and hosting, liaison with abstracting and indexing services, and
customer services. The publication charges are 1249 GBP for the accepted article. You
are required to process publication charges upon acceptance of your article (after peer-
review). Kindly confirm your response to proceed with the review process.  

We thank you for submitting your valuable work to the Pharmacognosy Journal.

Kindly get back to us for further queries.

Have a great day.!

Best regards,
Emily Flora
Managing Editor

mailto:editor.phcogi@gmail.com
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hamdan Muhammad <muhammad.hamdan@fk.unair.ac.id>

Manuscript Accepted for Publication -PJ-23-1153

Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> 29 April 2023 pukul 04.49
Kepada: hamdan Muhammad <muhammad.hamdan@fk.unair.ac.id>

Dear Hamdan,

Thanks for your email. Please send us the correction by highlighting the changes in the galley proof (not in word
document) on a sticky note and send us back, so that our production team will make the changes accordingly.

regards,
Emily Flora
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]
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hamdan Muhammad <muhammad.hamdan@fk.unair.ac.id>

Manuscript Accepted for Publication -PJ-23-1153

Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> 6 Mei 2023 pukul 06.33
Kepada: hamdan Muhammad <muhammad.hamdan@fk.unair.ac.id>

Dear Hamdan,

Please find the attached corrected galley proof.
Regards,
Emily Flora

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]
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hamdan Muhammad <muhammad.hamdan@fk.unair.ac.id> 1 Mei 2023 pukul 08.32
Kepada: Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com>

Dear Emily this is our correction. Thank you
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]
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hamdan Muhammad <muhammad.hamdan@fk.unair.ac.id>

Manuscript Accepted for Publication -PJ-23-1153

hamdan Muhammad <muhammad.hamdan@fk.unair.ac.id> 2 Maret 2023 pukul 19.56
Kepada: Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com>

Thank you for accepting our article. We plan to make payments via bank transfer. Thank You

Pada tanggal Kam, 2 Mar 2023 pukul 12.07 Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> menulis:

Mohammad Saiful Ardhi, Muhammad Hamdan, Achmad Chusnu Romdhoni:

We have reached a decision regarding your submission to Pharmacognosy Journal,
"Effect of Thiamine on Serum Glutamate in Ischemic Stroke Animal Model".

Our decision is to: Accept Submission

I truly appreciate all your hard work, dedication and commitments towards this work.
This paper is well described clearly and it is accepted to publish without any revisions.
Publication Charges - GBP 900 We request you to confirm your mode of payment 1)
Credit Card or 2) Bank Transfer. An invoice can be raised accordingly.
Awaiting your response.

Regards,
Emily Flora

On Tue, Feb 14, 2023 at 3:54 PM Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Hamdan,

Thank you for your kind response and confirming the charges. Soon, we will get back to you with the review
comments.
Regards,
Emily Flora

On Mon, Feb 13, 2023 at 8:11 PM hamdan Muhammad <muhammad.hamdan@fk.unair.ac.id> wrote:
Dear Emily, thank you for your email. we agreed with 900 GBP

Pada tanggal Sen, 13 Feb 2023 pukul 14.24 Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> menulis:
Dear Hamdan,

Thanks for your email. Kindly confirm the publication charges to initiate the review process.

regards,
Emily Flora

On Sun, Feb 12, 2023 at 4:10 PM hamdan Muhammad <muhammad.hamdan@fk.unair.ac.id> wrote:
Thank you for your kindness

Pada tanggal Sab, 11 Feb 2023 pukul 10.30 Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com>
menulis:

mailto:editor.phcogi@gmail.com
mailto:editor.phcogi@gmail.com
mailto:muhammad.hamdan@fk.unair.ac.id
mailto:editor.phcogi@gmail.com
mailto:muhammad.hamdan@fk.unair.ac.id
mailto:editor.phcogi@gmail.com
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Dear Hamdan,

Thanks for your email. We understand your concern. In this case, you are requested to pay 900 GBP
upon the article acceptance.

Kindly confirm to initiate the review process.

regards,
Emily Flora

On Fri, Feb 10, 2023 at 6:20 PM hamdan Muhammad <muhammad.hamdan@fk.unair.ac.id> wrote:
Thank you for this email.
Due to pandemic CoVid-19 and economic condition in our country., we unable to pay 1249 GBP.
Can we pay 600 GBP? 
Thank you for your attention

Best regards
Authors

Pada tanggal Jum, 10 Feb 2023 pukul 17.18 Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com>
menulis:

On Thu, Feb 9, 2023 at 12:05 PM Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Dr. Muhammad Hamdan',
 
Thank you very much for your submission to the Pharmacognosy Journal.
We have received your article entitled "Effect of Thiamine on Serum
Glutamate in Ischemic Stroke Animal Model”. The article is now under
our PRELIMINARY EVALUATION and we will keep you updated on the
article status accordingly.

As we are an open-access non-profit organization, we require publication
charges to recover our editorial and production expenses. They cover the
range of publishing services we provide which includes the provision of
online tools for editors and authors, article production and hosting, liaison
with abstracting and indexing services, and customer services. The
publication charges are 1249 GBP for the accepted article. You are
required to process publication charges upon acceptance of your article
(after peer-review). Kindly confirm your response to proceed with the
review process.  

We thank you for submitting your valuable work to the Pharmacognosy
Journal.

Kindly get back to us for further queries.

Have a great day.!

Best regards,

mailto:muhammad.hamdan@fk.unair.ac.id
mailto:editor.phcogi@gmail.com
mailto:editor.phcogi@gmail.com


25/06/23 20.25Email Airlangga University - Manuscript Accepted for Publication -PJ-23-1153

Page 3 of 3https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ik=b72369dd29&view=pt&searc…-4927013854539137597&dsqt=1&simpl=msg-a:r-4927013854539137597

Emily Flora
Managing Editor
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hamdan Muhammad <muhammad.hamdan@fk.unair.ac.id>

Manuscript Accepted for Publication -PJ-23-1153

hamdan Muhammad <muhammad.hamdan@fk.unair.ac.id> 2 Maret 2023 pukul 19.56
Kepada: Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com>

Thank you for accepting our article. We plan to make payments via bank transfer. Thank You
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]
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hamdan Muhammad <muhammad.hamdan@fk.unair.ac.id>

Manuscript Accepted for Publication -PJ-23-1153

Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> 6 Maret 2023 pukul 11.21
Kepada: hamdan Muhammad <muhammad.hamdan@fk.unair.ac.id>

Dear Hamdan,

Thank you for making the payment. Within 15 working days, you will receive the galley proof.
Regards,
Emily Flora
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]
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hamdan Muhammad <muhammad.hamdan@fk.unair.ac.id>

Manuscript Received & Peer Review Acceptance -PJ-23-1153

Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> 14 Februari 2023 pukul 09.54
Kepada: hamdan Muhammad <muhammad.hamdan@fk.unair.ac.id>

Dear Hamdan,

Thank you for your kind response and confirming the charges. Soon, we will get back to you with the review
comments.
Regards,
Emily Flora
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]
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upon the article acceptance.

Kindly confirm to initiate the review process.

regards,
Emily Flora

On Fri, Feb 10, 2023 at 6:20 PM hamdan Muhammad <muhammad.hamdan@fk.unair.ac.id> wrote:
Thank you for this email.
Due to pandemic CoVid-19 and economic condition in our country., we unable to pay 1249 GBP. Can
we pay 600 GBP? 
Thank you for your attention

Best regards
Authors

Pada tanggal Jum, 10 Feb 2023 pukul 17.18 Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com>
menulis:

On Thu, Feb 9, 2023 at 12:05 PM Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Dr. Muhammad Hamdan',
 
Thank you very much for your submission to the Pharmacognosy Journal.
We have received your article entitled "Effect of Thiamine on Serum
Glutamate in Ischemic Stroke Animal Model”. The article is now under our
PRELIMINARY EVALUATION and we will keep you updated on the
article status accordingly.

As we are an open-access non-profit organization, we require publication
charges to recover our editorial and production expenses. They cover the
range of publishing services we provide which includes the provision of
online tools for editors and authors, article production and hosting, liaison
with abstracting and indexing services, and customer services. The
publication charges are 1249 GBP for the accepted article. You are required
to process publication charges upon acceptance of your article (after peer-
review). Kindly confirm your response to proceed with the review process.  

We thank you for submitting your valuable work to the Pharmacognosy
Journal.

Kindly get back to us for further queries.

Have a great day.!

Best regards,
Emily Flora
Managing Editor

mailto:muhammad.hamdan@fk.unair.ac.id
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hamdan Muhammad <muhammad.hamdan@fk.unair.ac.id>

Manuscript Accepted for Publication -PJ-23-1153

Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> 15 April 2023 pukul 06.19
Kepada: hamdan Muhammad <muhammad.hamdan@fk.unair.ac.id>

Dear Hamdan,

Thanks for your email. Your article will be published in Volume 15 Issue 2 which will be released by end of this
month.

Regards,
Emily Flora
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]


