
Factors Affecting the Long-Term Protection against Hepatitis B Immunization in 

Infancy: a meta-analysis 

 

Tanggal 3 April 2023 corresponding author mendapatkan email dari editor :  

 

From: Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> 

Date: Mon, Apr 3, 2023 at 5:13 AM 

Subject: Manuscript Received & Peer Review Acceptance - PJ-23-1229 

To: Aldila Pratiwi <aldilapratiwi@gmail.com> 

 

Dear Dr.  Aldila Pratiwi', 

  

Thank you very much for your submission to the Pharmacognosy Journal. We have received 

your article entitled "Factors Affecting the Long-Term Protection against Hepatitis B 

Immunization in Infancy: a meta-analysis”. The article is now under our PRELIMINARY 

EVALUATION and we will keep you updated on the article status accordingly. 

 

As we are an open-access non-profit organization, we require publication charges to recover 

our editorial and production expenses. They cover the range of publishing services we 

provide which includes the provision of online tools for editors and authors, article 

production and hosting, liaison with abstracting and indexing services, and customer services. 

The publication charges are 1249 GBP for the accepted article. You are required to process 

publication charges upon acceptance of your article (after peer-review). Kindly confirm your 

response to proceed with the review process.   

 

We thank you for submitting your valuable work to the Pharmacognosy Journal. 

 

Kindly get back to us for further queries. 

 

Have a great day.! 

 

Best regards, 

Emily Flora 

Managing Editor 

 

Tanggal 20 April 2023 corresponding author mendapatkan email dari editor :  

 

From: Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> 

Date: 20 April 2023 06.59.56 GMT+7 

To: Aldila Pratiwi <aldilapratiwi@gmail.com> 

Subject: Manuscript Accepted for Publication- PJ-23-1229 

Aldila Pratiwi: 

 

We have reached a decision regarding your submission to Pharmacognosy Journal, "Factors 

Affecting the Long-Term Protection against Hepatitis B Immunization in Infancy: a meta-

analysis". 

 

Our decision is to: Accept Submission 

mailto:editor.phcogi@gmail.com
mailto:aldilapratiwi@gmail.com
mailto:editor.phcogi@gmail.com
mailto:aldilapratiwi@gmail.com


I truly appreciate all your hard work, dedication and commitments towards this work. This 

paper is well described clearly and it is accepted to publish without any revisions. 

Publication Charges - GBP 650 Kindly acknowledge, so that we can send you the credit card 

invoice accordingly. 

Awaiting your response. 

Regards, 

Emily Flora 



BAGUS SETYOBOEDI <bagus.setyoboedi@fk.unair.ac.id>

Fwd: Manuscript Accepted for Publication- PJ-23-1229
1 pesan

Aldila Pratiwi <aldilapratiwi@gmail.com> 17 Oktober 2023 pukul 13.29

Kepada: bagus.setyoboedi@fk.unair.ac.id

From: Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com>

Date: 20 April 2023 06.59.56 GMT+7

To: Aldila Pratiwi <aldilapratiwi@gmail.com>

Subject: Manuscript Accepted for Publication- PJ-23-1229

Aldila Pratiwi:

We have reached a decision regarding your submission to Pharmacognosy Journal, "Factors Affecting the Long-Term
Protection against Hepatitis B Immunization in Infancy: a meta-analysis".

Our decision is to: Accept Submission

I truly appreciate all your hard work, dedication and commitments towards this work. This paper is well described clearly
and it is accepted to publish without any revisions.

Publication Charges - GBP 650 Kindly acknowledge, so that we can send you the credit card invoice accordingly.

Awaiting your response.

Regards,
Emily Flora

Email Airlangga University - Fwd: Manuscript Accepted for Publication- PJ-23-1229 https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=a5f5551c78&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:...

1 of 1 11/01/2024, 15:02

mailto:editor.phcogi@gmail.com
mailto:editor.phcogi@gmail.com
mailto:aldilapratiwi@gmail.com
mailto:aldilapratiwi@gmail.com


BAGUS SETYOBOEDI <bagus.setyoboedi@fk.unair.ac.id>

Fwd: Manuscript Received & Peer Review Acceptance - PJ-23-1229
1 pesan

Aldila Pratiwi <aldilapratiwi@gmail.com> 19 Oktober 2023 pukul 19.54

Kepada: bagus.setyoboedi@fk.unair.ac.id

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com>

Date: Mon, Apr 3, 2023 at 5:13 AM

Subject: Manuscript Received & Peer Review Acceptance - PJ-23-1229

To: Aldila Pratiwi <aldilapratiwi@gmail.com>

Dear Dr.  Aldila Pratiwi',

Thank you very much for your submission to the Pharmacognosy Journal. We have received your article entitled "Factors Affecting
the Long-Term Protection against Hepatitis B Immunization in Infancy: a meta-analysis”. The article is now under our
PRELIMINARY EVALUATION and we will keep you updated on the article status accordingly.

As we are an open-access non-profit organization, we require publication charges to recover our editorial and production expenses.
They cover the range of publishing services we provide which includes the provision of online tools for editors and authors, article
production and hosting, liaison with abstracting and indexing services, and customer services. The publication charges are 1249
GBP for the accepted article. You are required to process publication charges upon acceptance of your article (after peer-review).
Kindly confirm your response to proceed with the review process.

We thank you for submitting your valuable work to the Pharmacognosy Journal.

Kindly get back to us for further queries.

Have a great day.!

Best regards,
Emily Flora
Managing Editor

Email Airlangga University - Fwd: Manuscript Received & Peer Review Acceptance - PJ-23-1229 https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=a5f5551c78&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:...

1 of 1 11/01/2024, 15:02

mailto:editor.phcogi@gmail.com
mailto:editor.phcogi@gmail.com
mailto:aldilapratiwi@gmail.com
mailto:aldilapratiwi@gmail.com

