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To: phsscientific@gmail.com; estihendradi@yahoo.com; dewiffua96@yahoo.com

Date: Monday, 30 July 2018, 08:26 am GMT+7
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Dear Editor,

We intend to publish an article entitled "Physical Properties of Bovine Serum Albumin Micropsheres using HPC-L and
Hypromellose 606 Polymer" in International Journal of Pharma Research and Health Sciences as a Research Article.
We confirm that this article is original, submitted solely to this journal, and not currently under consideration for
publication and not published elsewhere. On behalf of all the contributors I will act and guarantor and will correspond
with the journal from this point onward. We also report no conflicts of interest.

Thank you and looking forward to your positive response.
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Re: Provisional Acceptance "MS_15670"

From: Annisa Kartika Sari (annisakartikasr@gmail.com)

To: dewiffua96@yahoo.com

Date: Sunday, 12 August 2018, 10:12 pm GMT+7

On Sun, Aug 12, 2018, 7:53 PM Prof S. Bhanja <chiefeditorijprhs@gmail.com> wrote:
Title: physical properties of bovine serum albumin microspheres using HPC-l and Hypromellose 606
polymer

Dear Author,
Your  manuscript assigned no MS_15670 as reviewed by expert panel decided to accept and has been
recommended for publication by preliminary review in upcoming Issue (Vol6 Issue 4, 2018) of
"International Journal of Pharma Research and Health sciences" only after completion of all further
steps.
Kindly download the copyright form from Journal website www.pharmahealthsciences.net, fill and send
the scanned copy along with proof of payment of 50 USD (Reduced fees as per current journal
policy for developing country) only within 48 Hours . If it needs any modification, modified
manuscript may be sent.
 
The payment has to proceed directly through credit card/debit card/visa card/master card
using  PayPal       
 
Website: https://www.paypal.com
PayPal payee mail id: chiefeditorijprhs@gmail.com
 
 
Pls let us inform via mail as soon as possible, so that we can proceed earlier
1. Manuscript No and Title:
2. Bank name and Date of Fee deposition:
3. Scanned copy of payment detail:
4. CTA (Copyright transfer agreement form): 
 
 
With Best Regards,
EIC, IJPRHS
 
 
Note: Plagarism is offensive only, The journal don’t allow and encourage such kind of practice, Such
are coming against code of conduct and ethics and favours criminal offence.The Editors and Proprietor
shall not be responsible for any legal issues.
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From: Annisa Kartika Sari (annisakartikasr@gmail.com)

To: chiefeditorijprhs@gmail.com; estihendradi@yahoo.com; dewiffua96@yahoo.com

Date: Monday, 13 August 2018, 07:13 pm GMT+7

---------- Forwarded message ----------
From: "Annisa Kartika Sari" <annisakartikasr@gmail.com>
Date: Aug 13, 2018 5:48 PM
Subject: Re: Provisional Acceptance "MS_15670"
To: "Prof S. Bhanja" <chiefeditorijprhs@gmail.com>
Cc: 

Dear Editor,
 
Here we send the copyright form and proof of payment.
 
Author name = Esti Hendradi, Dewi Melani Hariyadi, Annisa Kartika Sari 
Manuscript No = MS_15670
 
Thank you
 
On Sun, Aug 12, 2018, 7:53 PM Prof S. Bhanja <chiefeditorijprhs@gmail.com> wrote:

Title: physical properties of bovine serum albumin microspheres using HPC-l and Hypromellose
606 polymer

Dear Author,
Your  manuscript assigned no MS_15670 as reviewed by expert panel decided to accept and has
been recommended for publication by preliminary review in upcoming Issue (Vol6 Issue 4, 2018) of
"International Journal of Pharma Research and Health sciences" only after completion of all further
steps.
Kindly download the copyright form from Journal website www.pharmahealthsciences.net, fill and
send the scanned copy along with proof of payment of 50 USD (Reduced fees as per current
journal policy for developing country) only within 48 Hours . If it needs any modification,
modified manuscript may be sent.
 
The payment has to proceed directly through credit card/debit card/visa card/master card
using  PayPal       
 
Website: https://www.paypal.com
PayPal payee mail id: chiefeditorijprhs@gmail.com
 
 
Pls let us inform via mail as soon as possible, so that we can proceed earlier
1. Manuscript No and Title:
2. Bank name and Date of Fee deposition:
3. Scanned copy of payment detail:
4. CTA (Copyright transfer agreement form): 
 
 
With Best Regards,
EIC, IJPRHS
 
 
Note: Plagarism is offensive only, The journal don’t allow and encourage such kind of practice, Such
are coming against code of conduct and ethics and favours criminal offence.The Editors and
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Proprietor shall not be responsible for any legal issues.
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From: Annisa Kartika Sari (annisakartikasr@gmail.com)

To: estihendradi@yahoo.com; dewiffua96@yahoo.com

Date: Wednesday, 12 September 2018, 04:18 pm GMT+7

vol6-issue4-2018-MS-15670.pdf
877.8kB

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: IJPRHS Office <pharmahealthsciences@gmail.com>
Date: Wed, Sep 12, 2018, 12:28 AM
Subject: Gallery proof "MS_15670"
To: <estihendradi@yahoo.com>, Annisa Kartika Sari <annisakartikasr@gmail.com>

Dear author,

Here with, find the attached gallery proof. The manuscript will be published in Volume-6, issue-4, 2018. If it needs any
modification, send us the modified within 48 Hrs. Further Modification may not be possible. 

With best Regards,

Publication manager
International Journal of Pharma Research and Health Sciences

mailto:pharmahealthsciences@gmail.com
mailto:estihendradi@yahoo.com
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Re: Gallery proof "MS_15670"

From: Annisa Kartika Sari (annisakartikasr@gmail.com)

To: pharmahealthsciences@gmail.com; estihendradi@yahoo.com; dewiffua96@yahoo.com

Date: Thursday, 13 September 2018, 12:51 pm GMT+7

Revised Manuscript Esti Hendradi et al.docx
1.2MB

Table of Revision Manuscript Esti Hendradi et al.docx
24.3kB

Dear Editor,

Here with, we attach the revision/modification of manuscript MS_15670. There are 2 files; The Revised Manuscript with
revision within it and Table of Revision. 
The revision in revised manuscript file mark as yellow cast.

With best Regards

Pada tanggal Rab, 12 Sep 2018 pukul 00.28 IJPRHS Office <pharmahealthsciences@gmail.com> menulis:
Dear author,
 
Here with, find the attached gallery proof. The manuscript will be published in Volume-6, issue-4, 2018. If it needs any
modification, send us the modified within 48 Hrs. Further Modification may not be possible. 
 
With best Regards,
 
Publication manager
International Journal of Pharma Research and Health Sciences

mailto:pharmahealthsciences@gmail.com

