
1/14/2021 Airlangga University Mail - [Pharmaciana] Submission Acknowledgement

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=2799125391&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1594275288227630396&simpl=msg-f%3A15942752882… 1/1

dewi melani hariyadi <dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id>

[Pharmaciana] Submission Acknowledgement 
1 message

Iin Narwanti, M.Sc <iin.narw@gmail.com> Thu, Mar 8, 2018 at 1:56 AM
To: Dewi Hariyadi <dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id>

Dewi Hariyadi: 

Thank you for submitting the manuscript, "FORMULATION AND EVALUATION OF 
ERYTHROPOIETIN-ALGINATE MICROSPHERES AT DIFFERENT AMOUNT OF DRUG" to 
Pharmaciana. With the online journal management system that we are using, 
you will be able to track its progress through the editorial process by 
logging in to the journal web site: 

Manuscript URL: 
http://journal.uad.ac.id/index.php/PHARMACIANA/author/submission/9203 
Username: dewiffua_96 

If you have any questions, please contact me. Thank you for considering this 
journal as a venue for your work. 

Iin Narwanti, M.Sc 
Pharmaciana 
________________________________________________________________________ 
Pharmaciana 
http://www.journal.uad.ac.id/index.php/Pharmaciana 

http://journal.uad.ac.id/index.php/PHARMACIANA/author/submission/9203
http://www.journal.uad.ac.id/index.php/Pharmaciana
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1 message

dewi melani hariyadi <dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id> Thu, Jul 19, 2018 at 12:34 PM
To: pharmaciana@pharm.uad.ac.id, iin.narw@gmail.com

Dear Editor, 

Please find attached the revised version of our manuscript (revisions are in green highlighted sentences or tables). New references
were also added in the references section and in the manuscript. Hopefully this revision fulfilled the journal requirements. I also
already sent it by online system. 
Looking forward for getting acceptance letter. 

Kind Regards, 
Dewi Melani Hariyadi, PhD, Apt.  

9203-25939-1-ED_REVISION 17072018.docx 
1002K
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Progress Manuscript Revision sejak 18 Juli 2018 ID 9203 

Nurkhasanah Mahfudh <nurkhas@gmail.com> Fri, Nov 2, 2018 at 9:06 AM
To: dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id

Terima kasih Bu..
Artikel ibu sdh accepted, ini dlm proses lay out.

On Fri, Nov 2, 2018 at 6:40 AM dewi melani hariyadi <dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id> wrote: 
Dear Chief Editor Dr. Nurkhasanah Mahfudh,
 
Saya Bu Dewi Melani Hariyadi dari FF Unair yang mengirimkan manuscript ke PHARMACIANA ID 9203 dan telah
merevisinya sesuai permintaan reviewer sejak 18 Juli 2018. Namun sudah beberapa bulan hingga sekarang di sistem
online tidak ada progress. Mohon dapat dikabarkan apakah revisi sudah bisa diterima sehingga jurnal bisa accepted
atau masih ada hal lain yang dibutuhkan.
Terima kasih atas perhatian dan kerjasamanya.
 
Salam,
Dewi Melani Hariyadi, PhD, Apt.

--  
Dr, Nurkhasanah, M.Si., Apt 
Fakultas Farmasi  
Universitas Ahmad Dahlan 
Yogyakarta 
Jl. Prof Soepomo, Janturan, Yogyakarta  

mailto:dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id
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2 messages

pharmaciana pharmaciana <pharmaciana@pharm.uad.ac.id> Fri, Nov 2, 2018 at 10:43 AM
To: dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id

Yth. Ibu Dewi Melani Hariyadi

Assalamu'alaikum Wr Wb  

Terlampir galley Proof Pharmaciana Edisi Nov  Vol 8 No 2 th 2018 beserta form revisi. Mohon untuk dicermati  apabila
ada revisi mohon untuk mengisi form tersebut dan dikirimkan ke kami kembali. maksimal  konfirmasi kami terima 3 hari
setelah galley ini kami kirim. apabila tanggal 5 Nov 2018 kami tidak menerima konfirmasi maka artikel tersebut akan kami
terbitkan.
terimaksih.  

Wassalamu'alaikum Wr Wb

--  
Pharmaciana 
Jurnal Kefarmasian, Universitas Ahmad Dahlan 
d.a Fakultas Farmasi Universitas Ahmad Dahlan Yogyakarta 
Jl. Prof Soepomo, Janturan Yogyakarta
-083145644382- 

----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------

UNIVERSITAS AHMAD DAHLAN 

Kampus 1: Jln. Kapas No. 9 Yogyakarta 

Kampus 2: Jl. Pramuka 42, Sidikan, Umbulharjo, Yogyakarta 55161 

Kampus 3: Jl. Prof. Dr. Soepomo, S.H., Janturan, Warungboto, Umbulharjo, Yogyakarta 55164 

Kampus 4: Jl.Ringroad Selatan, Yogyakarta 

Kampus 5: Jl. Ki Ageng Pemanahan 19, Yogyakarta 

Kontak

Email: info@uad.ac.id 

Telp. : (0274) 563515, 511830, 379418, 371120 

Fax. : (0274) 564604 

2 attachments

FORM REVISI GALLEY VERSION.docx 
34K

S_Hariyadi_galley.pdf 
657K

dewi melani hariyadi <dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id> Mon, Nov 5, 2018 at 10:52 AM
To: pharmaciana@pharm.uad.ac.id

Dear Editor,

Assalamu'alaikum Wr Wb    

http://uad.ac.id/
mailto:info@uad.ac.id
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Berikut saya lampirkan "Form Revisi Pharmaciana" artikel saya yang berjudul Formulation and Evaluation of
Erythropoietin-Alginate Microspheres at Different Amount of Drug. Saya sampaikan bahwa galley
proof tidak ada revisi dan sesuai dengan manuscript revisi terakhir . Terimakasih

Wassalamu'alaikum Wr Wb 
  
Dewi Melani Hariyadi
[Quoted text hidden]

Form Revisi Pharmaciana.pdf 
533K
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dewi melani hariyadi <dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id>

invoice 
3 messages

pharmaciana pharmaciana <pharmaciana@pharm.uad.ac.id> Sat, Nov 17, 2018 at 1:10 PM
To: dewi melani hariyadi <dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id>

Yth. Dewi Melani H

Assalamu'alaikum Wr Wb  

Terlampir invoice artikel dengan judul: Formulation and evaluation of erythropoietin-alginate microspheres at
different amount of drug
Terimakasih.

Wassalamu'alaikum Wr Wb

--  
Pharmaciana 
Jurnal Kefarmasian, Universitas Ahmad Dahlan 
d.a Fakultas Farmasi Universitas Ahmad Dahlan Yogyakarta 
Jl. Prof Soepomo, Janturan Yogyakarta
-083145644382- 

----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------

UNIVERSITAS AHMAD DAHLAN 

Kampus 1: Jln. Kapas No. 9 Yogyakarta 

Kampus 2: Jl. Pramuka 42, Sidikan, Umbulharjo, Yogyakarta 55161 

Kampus 3: Jl. Prof. Dr. Soepomo, S.H., Janturan, Warungboto, Umbulharjo, Yogyakarta 55164 

Kampus 4: Jl.Ringroad Selatan, Yogyakarta 

Kampus 5: Jl. Ki Ageng Pemanahan 19, Yogyakarta 

Kontak

Email: info@uad.ac.id 

Telp. : (0274) 563515, 511830, 379418, 371120 

Fax. : (0274) 564604 

39.Invoice submit  hariyadi.pdf 
204K

dewi melani hariyadi <dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id> Sat, Nov 17, 2018 at 1:24 PM
To: pharmaciana pharmaciana <pharmaciana@pharm.uad.ac.id>

Waalaikumsalam wr wb,

Terlampir bukti pembayaran manuskrip saya.
Terima kasih.

Salam,
Dewi Melani Hariyadi
[Quoted text hidden]

http://uad.ac.id/
https://www.google.com/maps/search/Jln.+Kapas+No.+9+Yogyakarta+Kampus+2?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/Jln.+Kapas+No.+9+Yogyakarta+Kampus+2?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/Jl.+Pramuka+42?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/Sidikan,+Umbulharjo,+Yogyakarta+55161+Kampus+3?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/Sidikan,+Umbulharjo,+Yogyakarta+55161+Kampus+3?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/Jl.+Ki+Ageng+Pemanahan+19,+Yogyakarta?entry=gmail&source=g
mailto:info@uad.ac.id
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ui=2&ik=2799125391&view=att&th=167204af9e6b748e&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=f_jol1zadd0&safe=1&zw


1/14/2021 Airlangga University Mail - invoice

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=2799125391&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1617360368503059598&simpl=msg-f%3A16173603685… 2/2

IMG_1430.PNG 
84K

pharmaciana pharmaciana <pharmaciana@pharm.uad.ac.id> Sat, Nov 17, 2018 at 1:43 PM
To: dewi melani hariyadi <dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id>

Terimakasih Ibu, terlampir bukti pembayarannya
Terimakasih 
[Quoted text hidden]
[Quoted text hidden]
WA: 083145644382 
[Quoted text hidden]
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