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dewi melani hariyadi <dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id> Thu, Feb 14, 2019 at 8:22 AM
To: drug delivery <ijddtjournal@gmail.com>

Dear Editor,

We intend to publish an article entitled “EXTRACTION AND PREFORMULATION STUDY OF DEER ANTLER VELVET
EXTRACT: PHYSICAL CHARACTERIZATION OF AQUEOUS AND ETHANOL EXTRACT” in International Journal of
Drug Delivery Technology as a Research Article.

We confirm that this article is original, submitted solely to this journal, and not currently under consideration for publication
and not published elsewhere. On behalf of all the contributors | will act and guarantor and will correspond with the journal
from this point onward. We also report no conflicts of interest.

We attached the manuscript and copyright form.

Thank you and looking forward to your positive response.
Yours'’ sincerely,

Dewi Melani Hariyadi, PhD, Apt.

2 attachments

ﬂ copyright IUDDT 2019.pdf
385K

@ Manuscript IJDDT Deer Extract 2019.docx
1469K

IJDDT Journal <ijddtjournal@gmail.com> Fri, Feb 15, 2019 at 12:58 PM
To: dewi melani hariyadi <dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id>

Manuscript is provided with number 02152019DDTA
[Quoted text hidden]

Editor

International Journal of Drug Delivery Technology
ISSN: 0975-4415

website: www.ijddt.com

IJDDT Journal <ijddtjournal@gmail.com> Wed, Jun 12, 2019 at 12:57 PM
To: dewi melani hariyadi <dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id>

Dear author

Your manuscript number " 02152019DDTA " bearing with title " EXTRACTION AND PREFORMULATION STUDY
OF DEER ANTLER VELVET EXTRACT: PHYSICAL CHARACTERIZATION OF AQUEOUS AND ETHANOL

EXTRACT " has been provisionally accepted after minor modifications. It may be published in the upcoming
issue of the journal subject to deposition of Open Access Fee USD200

The authors are required to use the paypal link available at this link www.ijddt.com/fee. Other modes are
not acceptable.

Note: The authors may reply this mail with modified manuscript containing minor typography errors if
left coincidently during submission. The errors must be highlighted clearly in red color font. The
modifications are subject to approval of editorial board. Any typological/coincidental error left after this
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stage will not be considered. In case the modifications are not minor, then authors may be asked to withdraw
and resubmit manuscript.

Important: After making a transaction, please confirm transaction by providing transaction details as
a reply to this mail only.

Publisher

[Quoted text hidden]

dewi melani hariyadi <dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id> Fri, Jun 14, 2019 at 1:48 PM
To: IJDDT Journal <ijddtjournal@gmail.com>

Dear Editor,

Please find attached payment receipt of my paypal for manuscript ID 02152019DDTA of USD 200 and final manuscript
(red font highlight as revision).

Hope now this can meet journal requirements for publication. Could you please inform which volume and month of this
manuscript will be published?

Thank you.

Kind Regards,
Dewi Melani Hariyadi
[Quoted text hidden]

2 attachments

ﬂ Payment IUDDT Manuscript No02152019DDTA.pdf
54K

@ Manuscript IJDDT Deer Extract 2019_final.docx
1484K

IJDDT Journal <ijddtjournal@gmail.com> Sun, Jun 16, 2019 at 12:53 PM
To: dewi melani hariyadi <dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id>

The manuscript will be published in upcoming issue
[Quoted text hidden]
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dewi melani hariyadi <dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id> Fri, Jun 14, 2019 at 1:48 PM
To: IJDDT Journal <ijddtjournal@gmail.com>

Dear Editor,

Please find attached payment receipt of my paypal for manuscript ID 02152019DDTA of USD 200 and final manuscript
(red font highlight as revision).

Hope now this can meet journal requirements for publication. Could you please inform which volume and month of this
manuscript will be published?

Thank you.

Kind Regards,
Dewi Melani Hariyadi
[Quoted text hidden]

2 attachments

ﬂ Payment IUDDT Manuscript No02152019DDTA.pdf
54K

@ Manuscript IJDDT Deer Extract 2019_final.docx
1484K
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IJDDT Journal <ijddtjournal@gmail.com> Sun, Jun 16, 2019 at 12:53 PM
To: dewi melani hariyadi <dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id>

The manuscript will be published in upcoming issue

On Fri, Jun 14, 2019 at 12:18 PM dewi melani hariyadi <dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id> wrote:
Dear Editor,

Please find attached payment receipt of my paypal for manuscript ID 02152019DDTA of USD 200 and final manuscript
(red font highlight as revision).

Hope now this can meet journal requirements for publication. Could you please inform which volume and month of this
manuscript will be published?

Thank you.

Kind Regards,
Dewi Melani Hariyadi

On Wed, Jun 12, 2019 at 12:57 PM IUJDDT Journal <ijddtjournal@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear author
Your manuscript number " 02152019DDTA " bearing with title " EXTRACTION AND PREFORMULATION
STUDY OF DEER ANTLER VELVET EXTRACT: PHYSICAL CHARACTERIZATION OF AQUEOUS AND ETHANOL
EXTRACT " has been provisionally accepted after minor modifications. It may be published in the
upcoming issue of the journal subject to deposition of Open Access Fee USD200
The authors are required to use the paypal link available at this link www.ijddt.com/fee. Other modes
are not acceptable.

Note: The authors may reply this mail with modified manuscript containing minor typography errors if
left coincidently during submission. The errors must be highlighted clearly in red color font. The
modifications are subject to approval of editorial board. Any typological/coincidental error left after this
stage will not be considered. In case the modifications are not minor, then authors may be asked to
withdraw and resubmit manuscript.

Important: After making a transaction, please confirm transaction by providing transaction
details as a reply to this mail only.

Publisher

On Fri, Feb 15, 2019 at 11:28 AM IJDDT Journal <ijddtjournal@gmail.com> wrote:
Manuscript is provided with number 02152019DDTA

On Thu, Feb 14, 2019 at 6:52 AM dewi melani hariyadi <dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id> wrote:
Dear Editor,
We intend to publish an article entitled “EXTRACTION AND PREFORMULATION STUDY OF DEER ANTLER
VELVET EXTRACT: PHYSICAL CHARACTERIZATION OF AQUEOUS AND ETHANOL EXTRACT” in
International Journal of Drug Delivery Technology as a Research Atrticle.
We confirm that this article is original, submitted solely to this journal, and not currently under consideration for
publication and not published elsewhere. On behalf of all the contributors | will act and guarantor and will
correspond with the journal from this point onward. We also report no conflicts of interest.
We attached the manuscript and copyright form.
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Thank you and looking forward to your positive response.
Yours’ sincerely,

Dewi Melani Hariyadi, PhD, Apt.

Editor

International Journal of Drug Delivery Technology
ISSN: 0975-4415

website: www.ijddt.com
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